

Exhibit B

Bielli & Klauder, LLC
 1204 North King Street
 Wilmington, DE 19801
 302-803-4600

March 27, 2025

Vyaire Medical, Inc.

Invoice Number: 3175
 Invoice Period: 10-30-2024 - 03-28-2025

Payment Terms: Upon Receipt

RE: Counsel to Fee Examiner

Time Details

Date	Professional	Task	Hours	Rate	Amount
10-30-2024	Thomas Bielli	B145 - Fee/Employment Applications - Retained Professionals Review file and correspondence from Fee Examiner to professionals with respect to items needed for fee review	0.30	490.00	147.00
10-30-2024	Brooke Hoffmann	B110 - Case Administration Upload Order Appointing Fee Examiner to GD	0.10	195.00	19.50
10-30-2024	Brooke Hoffmann	B110 - Case Administration Circulate Kirkland & Ellis data to Legal Decoder for analysis	0.10	195.00	19.50
10-30-2024	Brooke Hoffmann	B110 - Case Administration Upload McDermott first interim data to GD and circulate to legal decoder for analysis	0.10	195.00	19.50
10-31-2024	Brooke Hoffmann	B110 - Case Administration Communications with BDO for submission of data to fee examiner	0.10	195.00	19.50
10-31-2024	Brooke Hoffmann	B110 - Case Administration Upload McDermott September data to GD and transmit to Legal Decoder for analysis	0.10	195.00	19.50
11-01-2024	Brooke Hoffmann	B110 - Case Administration Upload BRG data to GD and circulate to Legal Decoder for analysis	0.10	195.00	19.50
11-01-2024	Brooke Hoffmann	B110 - Case Administration Upload BDO data to GD and circulate to Legal Decoder for analysis	0.10	195.00	19.50
11-04-2024	Brooke Hoffmann	B110 - Case Administration Attention to Assignment Log and updating file (0.2); prepare fee examiner letter chart (0.3); prepare template fee examiner reports (0.5)	1.00	195.00	195.00
11-08-2024	Brooke Hoffmann	B110 - Case Administration Update assignment log chart	0.10	195.00	19.50
11-10-2024	Brooke Hoffmann	B145 - Fee/Employment Applications - Retained Professionals Fee review	0.60	195.00	117.00

We appreciate your business

Date	Professional	Task	Hours	Rate	Amount
11-11-2024	Brooke Hoffmann	B145 - Fee/Employment Applications - Retained Professionals Fee review	5.80	195.00	1,131.00
11-12-2024	Brooke Hoffmann	B145 - Fee/Employment Applications - Retained Professionals Data review	0.40	195.00	78.00
11-15-2024	Brooke Hoffmann	B110 - Case Administration Status review	0.10	195.00	19.50
11-15-2024	Brooke Hoffmann	B110 - Case Administration Prepare BK retention application	0.90	195.00	175.50
11-15-2024	Thomas Bielli	B145 - Fee/Employment Applications - Retained Professionals Status update with Fee Examiner regarding reports	0.30	490.00	147.00
11-17-2024	Brooke Hoffmann	B145 - Fee/Employment Applications - Retained Professionals Draft fee review report templates	0.50	195.00	97.50
11-18-2024	Brooke Hoffmann	B110 - Case Administration Review and edit BK retention application	0.20	195.00	39.00
11-18-2024	Thomas Bielli	B145 - Fee/Employment Applications - Retained Professionals Review, revise and edit Retention Application	0.30	490.00	147.00
11-18-2024	Brooke Hoffmann	B145 - Fee/Employment Applications - Retained Professionals Continue preparing fee review reports	1.10	195.00	214.50
11-19-2024	Brooke Hoffmann	B110 - Case Administration Prepare BK retention application for filing	0.20	195.00	39.00
11-19-2024	Brooke Hoffmann	B110 - Case Administration File and serve BK retention application	0.30	195.00	58.50
11-19-2024	Brooke Hoffmann	B145 - Fee/Employment Applications - Retained Professionals Continue preparing fee reports	1.00	195.00	195.00
11-20-2024	Brooke Hoffmann	B145 - Fee/Employment Applications - Retained Professionals Fee review report preparation	2.90	195.00	565.50
11-20-2024	Brooke Hoffmann	B145 - Fee/Employment Applications - Retained Professionals Continue fee report preparation	1.00	195.00	195.00
11-21-2024	Brooke Hoffmann	B110 - Case Administration Upload received LEDEs data to GD and transmit to Legal Decoder for analysis	0.30	195.00	58.50

We appreciate your business

Date	Professional	Task	Hours	Rate	Amount
11-23-2024	Brooke Hoffmann	B145 - Fee/Employment Applications - Retained Professionals Continue to prepare fee report	0.30	195.00	58.50
11-25-2024	Brooke Hoffmann	B110 - Case Administration Upload September and October data to GD and transmit to Legal Decoder for analysis	0.10	195.00	19.50
11-26-2024	Brooke Hoffmann	B110 - Case Administration Download PJT Partners first interim data for review	0.10	195.00	19.50
11-27-2024	Brooke Hoffmann	B145 - Fee/Employment Applications - Retained Professionals Review PJT Partners data	1.40	195.00	273.00
12-01-2024	Thomas Bielli	B145 - Fee/Employment Applications - Retained Professionals Review BRG's Fee Application; correspondence with team regarding back up data; preliminary draft of Fee Examiner's Report	1.50	490.00	735.00
12-01-2024	Thomas Bielli	B145 - Fee/Employment Applications - Retained Professionals Review MWE's Fee Application; conference with team regarding data	1.00	490.00	490.00
12-01-2024	Brooke Hoffmann	B110 - Case Administration Continue review of PJT data	0.70	195.00	136.50
12-02-2024	Brooke Hoffmann	B110 - Case Administration Prepare final report and spreadsheets for sending	0.60	195.00	117.00
12-02-2024	Brooke Hoffmann	B145 - Fee/Employment Applications - Retained Professionals Continue reviewing PJT Partners data	1.20	195.00	234.00
12-02-2024	Thomas Bielli	B145 - Fee/Employment Applications - Retained Professionals Conference with Fee Examiner with respect to BRG report; review final version of same	0.20	490.00	98.00
12-02-2024	Thomas Bielli	B145 - Fee/Employment Applications - Retained Professionals Review Fee Examiner's Report to Berkeley Research Group LLC; input same into tracking software	0.30	490.00	147.00
12-02-2024	Thomas Bielli	B145 - Fee/Employment Applications - Retained Professionals Review Fee Examiner's Report to Cole Schotz; input same into tracking software	0.20	490.00	98.00
12-02-2024	Thomas Bielli	B145 - Fee/Employment Applications - Retained Professionals Review Fee Examiner's Report to Kirkland & Ellis LLP; input same into tracking software	0.20	490.00	98.00
12-02-2024	Brooke Hoffmann	B145 - Fee/Employment Applications - Retained Professionals Finish Review of PJT data	0.60	195.00	117.00
12-02-2024	Brooke Hoffmann	B145 - Fee/Employment Applications - Retained Professionals	1.30	195.00	253.50

We appreciate your business

Date	Professional	Task	Hours	Rate	Amount
		Prepare PJT fee report			
12-02-2024	Thomas Bielli	B145 - Fee/Employment Applications - Retained Professionals	1.00	490.00	490.00
		Continue Fee Examiner's Report; correspondence with Fee Examiner regarding details and reductions			
12-02-2024	Thomas Bielli	B145 - Fee/Employment Applications - Retained Professionals	1.20	490.00	588.00
		Review Fee App and commence working draft of Fee Examiner's Report			
12-03-2024	Brooke Hoffmann	B110 - Case Administration	1.00	195.00	195.00
		Continue preparing fee report			
12-04-2024	Thomas Bielli	B145 - Fee/Employment Applications - Retained Professionals	1.40	490.00	686.00
		Review working draft of Fee Examiner's Report for MWE; correspondence and conference with Fee Examiner with respect to same			
12-04-2024	Brooke Hoffmann	B110 - Case Administration	0.50	195.00	97.50
		Prepare Fee Examiner reports for sending			
12-04-2024	Brooke Hoffmann	B110 - Case Administration	0.20	195.00	39.00
		Prepare Certificate of No Objection to BK retention application			
12-04-2024	Thomas Bielli	B145 - Fee/Employment Applications - Retained Professionals	2.50	490.00	1,225.00
		Review working draft of Fee Examiner's Report for BDO; correspondence and conference with Fee Examiner with respect to same			
12-04-2024	Thomas Bielli	B145 - Fee/Employment Applications - Retained Professionals	0.50	490.00	245.00
		Review, revise and edit MWE Fee Examiner's Report			
12-04-2024	Brooke Hoffmann	B110 - Case Administration	0.20	195.00	39.00
		File Certificate of No Objection for BK retention application and upload Order for same			
12-04-2024	Thomas Bielli	B145 - Fee/Employment Applications - Retained Professionals	0.30	490.00	147.00
		Review Fee Examiner's Report to BDO; input same into tracking software			
12-04-2024	Thomas Bielli	B145 - Fee/Employment Applications - Retained Professionals	0.30	490.00	147.00
		Review Kirkland's response to Fee Examiner's Report; conference with Fee Examiner regarding same			
12-04-2024	Thomas Bielli	B145 - Fee/Employment Applications - Retained Professionals	0.30	490.00	147.00
		Review Fee Examiner's Report to BDO; input same into tracking software			
12-04-2024	Thomas Bielli	B145 - Fee/Employment Applications - Retained Professionals	0.30	490.00	147.00
		Review Fee Examiner's Report to MWE; input same into tracking software			
12-04-2024	Thomas Bielli	B145 - Fee/Employment Applications - Retained Professionals	0.30	490.00	147.00
		Review Fee Examiner's Report to PJT; input same into tracking software			

We appreciate your business

Date	Professional	Task	Hours	Rate	Amount
12-04-2024	Thomas Bielli	B145 - Fee/Employment Applications - Retained Professionals Review response from PJT to Fee Examiner's Report; correspondence and conference with Fee Examiner regarding same	0.20	490.00	98.00
12-04-2024	Thomas Bielli	B145 - Fee/Employment Applications - Retained Professionals Review response from Kirkland to Fee Examiner's Report	0.20	490.00	98.00
12-04-2024	Thomas Bielli	B145 - Fee/Employment Applications - Retained Professionals Review correspondence to/from Cole Schotz and Fee Examiner regarding resolution of fee examiner's report	0.20	490.00	98.00
12-05-2024	Brooke Hoffmann	B110 - Case Administration Draft Final Fee Report	1.30	195.00	253.50
12-05-2024	Brooke Hoffmann	B110 - Case Administration Upload Order Approving Application to Employ Bielli & Klauder, LLC as Counsel to the Fee Examiner to GD	0.10	195.00	19.50
12-05-2024	Brooke Hoffmann	B110 - Case Administration Upload data from PJT partners to GD and transmit to Legal Decoder for analysis	0.10	195.00	19.50
12-05-2024	Thomas Bielli	B145 - Fee/Employment Applications - Retained Professionals Review PJT Data	0.10	490.00	49.00
12-05-2024	Thomas Bielli	B145 - Fee/Employment Applications - Retained Professionals Review tracking spreadsheet	0.30	490.00	147.00
12-06-2024	Brooke Hoffmann	B110 - Case Administration Edit fee examiner final report	0.20	195.00	39.00
12-06-2024	Thomas Bielli	B145 - Fee/Employment Applications - Retained Professionals Correspondence with MWE regarding consult with Fee Examiner regarding report	0.20	490.00	98.00
12-06-2024	Thomas Bielli	B145 - Fee/Employment Applications - Retained Professionals Prepare for and participate in conference (teams) with BRG with respect to Fee Examiner's Report and resolution of same	0.40	490.00	196.00
12-06-2024	Thomas Bielli	B145 - Fee/Employment Applications - Retained Professionals Review correspondence from BRG regarding resolution of Fee Examiner's Report	0.20	490.00	98.00
12-06-2024	Thomas Bielli	B145 - Fee/Employment Applications - Retained Professionals Review response from BDO to Fee Examiner with respect to Fee Report; input same into tracking software	0.30	490.00	147.00
12-06-2024	Thomas Bielli	B145 - Fee/Employment Applications - Retained Professionals Review Fee Examiner's Final Report; correspond with team regarding same	0.40	490.00	196.00

We appreciate your business

Date	Professional	Task	Hours	Rate	Amount
12-09-2024	Brooke Hoffmann	B110 - Case Administration Edit Final Report	0.40	195.00	78.00
12-09-2024	Brooke Hoffmann	B110 - Case Administration Prep and file Final Fee Report	0.20	195.00	39.00
12-09-2024	Brooke Hoffmann	B110 - Case Administration Upload data to GD and transmit to Legal Decoder for analysis	0.10	195.00	19.50
12-09-2024	Thomas Bielli	B145 - Fee/Employment Applications - Retained Professionals Review, revise and edit Fee Examiner's Final Report and coordinate filing of same	1.50	490.00	735.00
12-09-2024	Thomas Bielli	B145 - Fee/Employment Applications - Retained Professionals Review correspondence from MWE with respect to Fee Examiner's Report	0.20	490.00	98.00
12-09-2024	Thomas Bielli	B145 - Fee/Employment Applications - Retained Professionals Review proposed form of order	0.50	490.00	245.00
12-16-2024	Brooke Hoffmann	B110 - Case Administration Begin preparing Second Interim assignment log	0.20	195.00	39.00
12-18-2024	Brooke Hoffmann	B110 - Case Administration Begin editing assignment log and downloading data for second interim fee reviews	0.30	195.00	58.50
12-18-2024	Brooke Hoffmann	B145 - Fee/Employment Applications - Retained Professionals Fee review	0.60	195.00	117.00
12-19-2024	Brooke Hoffmann	B110 - Case Administration Upload Kirkland & Ellis November data and transmit to Legal Decoder for analysis	0.20	195.00	39.00
12-19-2024	Brooke Hoffmann	B145 - Fee/Employment Applications - Retained Professionals Data review	0.60	195.00	117.00
12-20-2024	Brooke Hoffmann	B145 - Fee/Employment Applications - Retained Professionals Data review	2.40	195.00	468.00
12-27-2024	Brooke Hoffmann	B110 - Case Administration Review outstanding data	0.30	195.00	58.50
12-30-2024	Brooke Hoffmann	B110 - Case Administration Prepare report templates	0.50	195.00	97.50
12-30-2024	Brooke Hoffmann	B145 - Fee/Employment Applications - Retained Professionals Data review	1.80	195.00	351.00
12-30-2024	Brooke Hoffmann	B110 - Case Administration Upload received data to GD and transmit to Legal Decoder for analysis	0.30	195.00	58.50

We appreciate your business

Date	Professional	Task	Hours	Rate	Amount
12-30-2024	Thomas Bielli	B145 - Fee/Employment Applications - Retained Professionals Correspondence to/from team with respect to final fee applications and next steps	0.20	490.00	98.00
12-31-2024	Brooke Hoffmann	B110 - Case Administration Update assignment log	0.10	195.00	19.50
12-31-2024	Brooke Hoffmann	B145 - Fee/Employment Applications - Retained Professionals Data review	1.50	195.00	292.50
01-02-2025	Brooke Hoffmann	B110 - Case Administration Prepare fee examiner letter chart for PJT and Kirkland	0.30	195.00	58.50
01-03-2025	Brooke Hoffmann	B110 - Case Administration Update assignment log	0.10	195.00	19.50
01-06-2025	Brooke Hoffmann	B145 - Fee/Employment Applications - Retained Professionals Download November data for K&E and MWE from Legal Decoder to review	0.20	195.00	39.00
01-06-2025	Brooke Hoffmann	B110 - Case Administration Provide status update to Fee Examiner	0.10	195.00	19.50
01-06-2025	Brooke Hoffmann	B145 - Fee/Employment Applications - Retained Professionals Data review	0.30	195.00	58.50
01-07-2025	Brooke Hoffmann	B145 - Fee/Employment Applications - Retained Professionals Data review	2.40	195.00	468.00
01-08-2025	Brooke Hoffmann	B110 - Case Administration Update Assignment Log	0.20	195.00	39.00
01-08-2025	Brooke Hoffmann	B145 - Fee/Employment Applications - Retained Professionals Prepare data review reports	0.50	195.00	97.50
01-09-2025	Brooke Hoffmann	B145 - Fee/Employment Applications - Retained Professionals Continue data review report preparation	1.20	195.00	234.00
01-10-2025	Brooke Hoffmann	B145 - Fee/Employment Applications - Retained Professionals Continue preparing review reports	0.60	195.00	117.00
01-15-2025	Brooke Hoffmann	B110 - Case Administration Prepare Fee Report letters for sending	0.20	195.00	39.00
01-16-2025	Brooke Hoffmann	B110 - Case Administration Attention to Assignment Log and status of data	0.20	195.00	39.00

We appreciate your business

Date	Professional	Task	Hours	Rate	Amount
01-21-2025	Brooke Hoffmann	B110 - Case Administration Prepare final report for Kirkland & PJT fee applications	0.50	195.00	97.50
01-21-2025	Brooke Hoffmann	B110 - Case Administration Finalize and File final report for Kirkland & PJT Partners	0.20	195.00	39.00
01-24-2025	Brooke Hoffmann	B145 - Fee/Employment Applications - Retained Professionals Continue fee review	1.50	195.00	292.50
01-27-2025	Brooke Hoffmann	B145 - Fee/Employment Applications - Retained Professionals Continue review of Cole Schotz data (2.0); review of MWE November data (0.6); review of BRG November data (0.3)	2.90	195.00	565.50
01-28-2025	Brooke Hoffmann	B145 - Fee/Employment Applications - Retained Professionals Prepare Cole Schotz fee review report	1.30	195.00	253.50
01-28-2025	Brooke Hoffmann	B110 - Case Administration Complete fee examiner letter chart	0.20	195.00	39.00
01-28-2025	Brooke Hoffmann	B110 - Case Administration Prepare Vyaire fee report templates	0.60	195.00	117.00
01-29-2025	Brooke Hoffmann	B110 - Case Administration Continue preparing cole schotz report	0.40	195.00	78.00
01-29-2025	Brooke Hoffmann	B145 - Fee/Employment Applications - Retained Professionals Prepare BDO review report	0.40	195.00	78.00
01-30-2025	Brooke Hoffmann	B145 - Fee/Employment Applications - Retained Professionals Continue drafting BDO fee report	1.10	195.00	214.50
01-30-2025	Brooke Hoffmann	B145 - Fee/Employment Applications - Retained Professionals Begin preparing McDermott fee review report	0.70	195.00	136.50
02-02-2025	Brooke Hoffmann	B145 - Fee/Employment Applications - Retained Professionals Finalize BRG report	0.50	195.00	97.50
02-03-2025	Brooke Hoffmann	B145 - Fee/Employment Applications - Retained Professionals Review Omni fee application and prepare review report	1.00	195.00	195.00
02-13-2025	Brooke Hoffmann	B110 - Case Administration Prepare fee examiner final reports for sending	0.40	195.00	78.00
02-14-2025	Thomas Bielli	B145 - Fee/Employment Applications - Retained Professionals Review fee examiner's report to BDO USA P.C	0.30	490.00	147.00

We appreciate your business

Date	Professional	Task	Hours	Rate	Amount
02-17-2025	Brooke Hoffmann	B145 - Fee/Employment Applications - Retained Professionals Prepare fee examiner reports for sending	0.20	195.00	39.00
02-18-2025	Brooke Hoffmann	B110 - Case Administration Update fee examiner letter chart with Cole Schotz resolutions	0.10	195.00	19.50
02-24-2025	Brooke Hoffmann	B110 - Case Administration Begin drafting final report	1.10	195.00	214.50
02-25-2025	Brooke Hoffmann	B110 - Case Administration Review and finalize final fee report	0.30	195.00	58.50
02-25-2025	Brooke Hoffmann	B110 - Case Administration File final report for second interim fee applications	0.20	195.00	39.00
03-26-2025	Brooke Hoffmann	B110 - Case Administration Prepare, edit, file and serve Fee Examiner and Counsel final fee applications	3.50	195.00	682.50
Total					20,304.50

Time Summary

Professional	Hours	Amount
Brooke Hoffmann	59.90	11,680.50
Thomas Bielli	17.60	8,624.00
Total		20,304.50
Task	Hours	Amount
B110 - Case Administration	20.10	3,919.50
B145 - Fee/Employment Applications - Retained Professionals	57.40	16,385.00
Total Fees		20,304.50

Total for this Invoice 20,304.50

We appreciate your business