

Exhibit B

Bielli & Klauder, LLC
 1204 North King Street
 Wilmington, DE 19801
 302-803-4600

March 27, 2025

Vyaire Medical, Inc.

Invoice Number: 3176
 Invoice Period: 10-30-2024 - 03-28-2025

Payment Terms: Upon Receipt

RE: Fee Examiner

Time Details

Date	Professional	Task	Hours	Rate	Amount
10-30-2024	David Klauder	B145 - Fee/Employment Applications - Retained Professionals Review order appointing me as fee examiner and various emails re: same	0.30	525.00	157.50
10-30-2024	David Klauder	B145 - Fee/Employment Applications - Retained Professionals Review email with fee data from MWE	0.10	525.00	52.50
10-31-2024	David Klauder	B145 - Fee/Employment Applications - Retained Professionals Emails with professionals re: electronic fee data	0.20	525.00	105.00
11-01-2024	David Klauder	B145 - Fee/Employment Applications - Retained Professionals Emails with various professionals re: interim fee apps and electronic info provided	0.30	525.00	157.50
11-04-2024	David Klauder	B145 - Fee/Employment Applications - Retained Professionals Discuss status of interim fee apps with B. Hoffmann	0.10	525.00	52.50
11-15-2024	David Klauder	B110 - Case Administration Emails with B. Hoffmann re: fee review status	0.10	525.00	52.50
11-18-2024	David Klauder	B155 - BK/Fee Examiner - Retention and Fee Applications Review and edit BK retention app and various emails with BK team re: same	0.50	525.00	262.50
11-18-2024	David Klauder	B145 - Fee/Employment Applications - Retained Professionals Review email from Kirkland re: fee reductions with UST	0.10	525.00	52.50
11-19-2024	David Klauder	B155 - BK/Fee Examiner - Retention and Fee Applications Review BK retention app and coordinate filing	0.30	525.00	157.50
11-21-2024	David Klauder	B145 - Fee/Employment Applications - Retained Professionals Emails with PJT Partners re: electronic fee data and receipt of same	0.20	525.00	105.00

We appreciate your business

Date	Professional	Task	Hours	Rate	Amount
11-21-2024	David Klauder	B145 - Fee/Employment Applications - Retained Professionals Emails with Kirkland re: fee data	0.10	525.00	52.50
11-26-2024	David Klauder	B145 - Fee/Employment Applications - Retained Professionals Review status of interim fee review and BK team assignments	0.20	525.00	105.00
11-27-2024	David Klauder	B145 - Fee/Employment Applications - Retained Professionals Emails with P. Reilley re: fee review status	0.10	525.00	52.50
12-01-2024	David Klauder	B145 - Fee/Employment Applications - Retained Professionals Interim fee analysis/review for Kirkland & Ellis	1.50	525.00	787.50
12-01-2024	David Klauder	B145 - Fee/Employment Applications - Retained Professionals Interim fee analysis/review for Cole Schotz	0.80	525.00	420.00
12-01-2024	David Klauder	B145 - Fee/Employment Applications - Retained Professionals Review interim fee app for PJT Partners	0.40	525.00	210.00
12-02-2024	David Klauder	B145 - Fee/Employment Applications - Retained Professionals Review BRG interim fee analysis and interim report and discussions with T. Bielli	0.40	525.00	210.00
12-02-2024	David Klauder	B145 - Fee/Employment Applications - Retained Professionals Interim fee analysis for various professionals and edit interim reports	0.80	525.00	420.00
12-02-2024	David Klauder	B145 - Fee/Employment Applications - Retained Professionals Final review of interim report for BRG interim fee app and send out same	0.20	525.00	105.00
12-02-2024	David Klauder	B145 - Fee/Employment Applications - Retained Professionals Final review of interim report letters and attachments for Kirkland and Cole Schotz and send out same	0.60	525.00	315.00
12-02-2024	David Klauder	B145 - Fee/Employment Applications - Retained Professionals Review interim fee analysis for McDermott Will and discussions re: same	0.40	525.00	210.00
12-03-2024	David Klauder	B145 - Fee/Employment Applications - Retained Professionals Discussions with BK team re: PJT partners and electronic fee data	0.20	525.00	105.00
12-03-2024	David Klauder	B145 - Fee/Employment Applications - Retained Professionals Interim fee review/analysis for PJT Partners and begin prep of interim report letter	0.50	525.00	262.50
12-04-2024	David Klauder	B145 - Fee/Employment Applications - Retained Professionals	0.50	525.00	262.50

We appreciate your business

Date	Professional	Task	Hours	Rate	Amount
		Review Cole Schotz response to interim report and additional info provided and various emails with them re: same			
12-04-2024	David Klauder	B145 - Fee/Employment Applications - Retained Professionals Final review of interim report for PJT Partners and coordinate sending out of same	0.40	525.00	210.00
12-04-2024	David Klauder	B155 - BK/Fee Examiner - Retention and Fee Applications Review CNO for BK retention app and coordinate filing	0.10	525.00	52.50
12-04-2024	David Klauder	B145 - Fee/Employment Applications - Retained Professionals Review BDO interim fee analysis and discuss with T. Bielli	0.30	525.00	157.50
12-04-2024	David Klauder	B145 - Fee/Employment Applications - Retained Professionals Review MWE interim report and discuss with T. Bielli	0.30	525.00	157.50
12-04-2024	David Klauder	B145 - Fee/Employment Applications - Retained Professionals Review and analyze Kirkland & Ellis response to interim report and reply accordingly	0.30	525.00	157.50
12-04-2024	David Klauder	B145 - Fee/Employment Applications - Retained Professionals Review of various interim reports and send out same	0.30	525.00	157.50
12-04-2024	David Klauder	B145 - Fee/Employment Applications - Retained Professionals Review fee examiner order and docket to determine all professional fees have been reviewed	0.30	525.00	157.50
12-05-2024	David Klauder	B145 - Fee/Employment Applications - Retained Professionals Review status of fee reviews and emails with debtor's counsel re: same	0.20	525.00	105.00
12-06-2024	David Klauder	B145 - Fee/Employment Applications - Retained Professionals Review status of fee review and emails with MWE re: same	0.20	525.00	105.00
12-06-2024	David Klauder	B145 - Fee/Employment Applications - Retained Professionals Review interim report and issues raised for BRG and emails and discussion with them to resolve	0.50	525.00	262.50
12-06-2024	David Klauder	B145 - Fee/Employment Applications - Retained Professionals Emails with debtor's counsel re: status of fee reviews	0.10	525.00	52.50
12-06-2024	David Klauder	B145 - Fee/Employment Applications - Retained Professionals Emails with BDO re: resolution of interim report issues	0.10	525.00	52.50
12-06-2024	David Klauder	B145 - Fee/Employment Applications - Retained Professionals Review final report	0.30	525.00	157.50

We appreciate your business

Date	Professional	Task	Hours	Rate	Amount
12-09-2024	David Klauder	B145 - Fee/Employment Applications - Retained Professionals Discuss fee review status with T. Bielli	0.10	525.00	52.50
12-09-2024	David Klauder	B145 - Fee/Employment Applications - Retained Professionals Review interim report for MWE and call/emails with them to resolve issues	0.40	525.00	210.00
12-09-2024	David Klauder	B145 - Fee/Employment Applications - Retained Professionals Emails with debtor's counsel re: resolution of interim fee issues and fee hearing	0.20	525.00	105.00
12-09-2024	David Klauder	B145 - Fee/Employment Applications - Retained Professionals Review and comment on final report, review edits and coordinate filing	0.80	525.00	420.00
12-09-2024	David Klauder	B145 - Fee/Employment Applications - Retained Professionals Review proposed omnibus fee order and emails re: same	0.20	525.00	105.00
12-09-2024	David Klauder	B110 - Case Administration Review hearing agenda	0.10	525.00	52.50
12-10-2024	David Klauder	B110 - Case Administration Review agenda canceling hearing	0.10	525.00	52.50
12-12-2024	David Klauder	B145 - Fee/Employment Applications - Retained Professionals Emails with K&E re: Sept monthly fee stmt	0.10	525.00	52.50
12-16-2024	David Klauder	B110 - Case Administration Emails with debtor's counsel and BK team re: final fee app schedule/timing	0.20	525.00	105.00
12-17-2024	David Klauder	B145 - Fee/Employment Applications - Retained Professionals Review order approving completion fee to AP Services	0.10	525.00	52.50
12-26-2024	David Klauder	B145 - Fee/Employment Applications - Retained Professionals Review email with MWE fee app	0.10	525.00	52.50
12-27-2024	David Klauder	B145 - Fee/Employment Applications - Retained Professionals Review status of final fee review	0.20	525.00	105.00
12-27-2024	David Klauder	B145 - Fee/Employment Applications - Retained Professionals Review email from Kirkland re: CNO for fee app	0.10	525.00	52.50
12-30-2024	David Klauder	B145 - Fee/Employment Applications - Retained Professionals Review status of final fee review for various professionals, and several emails and follow ups with professionals re: electronic fee data	0.50	525.00	262.50
12-30-2024	David Klauder	B145 - Fee/Employment Applications - Retained Professionals	0.20	525.00	105.00

We appreciate your business

Date	Professional	Task	Hours	Rate	Amount
		Professionals			
		Emails with debtor's counsel and BK team re: final fee schedule and review schedule			
01-06-2025	David Klauder	B145 - Fee/Employment Applications - Retained Professionals	0.20	525.00	105.00
		Call with debtor's counsel re: status of fee reviews and final fee app schedule			
01-06-2025	David Klauder	B145 - Fee/Employment Applications - Retained Professionals	0.30	525.00	157.50
		Discuss status of final fee app reviews with BK team			
01-08-2025	David Klauder	B145 - Fee/Employment Applications - Retained Professionals	0.10	525.00	52.50
		Emails re: Kirkland monthly fee stmt			
01-09-2025	David Klauder	B145 - Fee/Employment Applications - Retained Professionals	0.20	525.00	105.00
		Emails with debtor's counsel and BK team re: final fee hearing and final fee app review			
01-10-2025	David Klauder	B145 - Fee/Employment Applications - Retained Professionals	1.50	525.00	787.50
		Review of final fee apps and analysis for K&E and PJT			
01-13-2025	David Klauder	B145 - Fee/Employment Applications - Retained Professionals	0.80	525.00	420.00
		Edit interim report letters for K&E and PJT			
01-15-2025	David Klauder	B145 - Fee/Employment Applications - Retained Professionals	0.50	525.00	262.50
		Final review of interim report letters to Kirkland and PJT, coordinate sending out of same			
01-16-2025	David Klauder	B145 - Fee/Employment Applications - Retained Professionals	0.20	525.00	105.00
		Emails with Cole Schotz re: status of final fee apps			
01-16-2025	David Klauder	B145 - Fee/Employment Applications - Retained Professionals	0.40	525.00	210.00
		Review Kirkland response to interim report issues and reply accordingly			
01-16-2025	David Klauder	B145 - Fee/Employment Applications - Retained Professionals	0.10	525.00	52.50
		Follow up emails with Kirkland re: resolution of issues			
01-21-2025	David Klauder	B145 - Fee/Employment Applications - Retained Professionals	0.50	525.00	262.50
		Review and edit final report for K&E and PJT final fee apps and coordinate filing			
01-21-2025	David Klauder	B145 - Fee/Employment Applications - Retained Professionals	0.10	525.00	52.50
		Emails with debtor's counsel re: final fee review of K&E and PJT			
01-21-2025	David Klauder	B145 - Fee/Employment Applications - Retained Professionals	0.10	525.00	52.50
		Review and sign off on final fee order for K&E and PJT			

We appreciate your business

Date	Professional	Task	Hours	Rate	Amount
02-02-2025	David Klauder	B145 - Fee/Employment Applications - Retained Professionals Discuss status of final fee review with BK team	0.10	525.00	52.50
02-04-2025	David Klauder	B145 - Fee/Employment Applications - Retained Professionals Initial review of final fee analysis for several professionals	0.50	525.00	262.50
02-05-2025	David Klauder	B145 - Fee/Employment Applications - Retained Professionals Interim/final fee review and analysis	1.80	525.00	945.00
02-10-2025	David Klauder	B145 - Fee/Employment Applications - Retained Professionals Work on interim reports for Cole Schotz, BDO and BRG	0.80	525.00	420.00
02-12-2025	David Klauder	B145 - Fee/Employment Applications - Retained Professionals Final edits to interim reports for Cole Schotz & BDO and prepare to send out	0.40	525.00	210.00
02-13-2025	David Klauder	B145 - Fee/Employment Applications - Retained Professionals Complete interim reports for Cole Schotz and BDO and send out same	0.30	525.00	157.50
02-13-2025	David Klauder	B145 - Fee/Employment Applications - Retained Professionals Interim/final fee analysis for McDermott and prepare interim report	1.00	525.00	525.00
02-13-2025	David Klauder	B145 - Fee/Employment Applications - Retained Professionals Interim/final fee analysis for BRG and prepare interim report	0.80	525.00	420.00
02-16-2025	David Klauder	B145 - Fee/Employment Applications - Retained Professionals Emails with D. Hurst re: UCC fee app review	0.10	525.00	52.50
02-16-2025	David Klauder	B145 - Fee/Employment Applications - Retained Professionals Review current status of fee review	0.20	525.00	105.00
02-17-2025	David Klauder	B145 - Fee/Employment Applications - Retained Professionals Final review of interim report letters for BRG and MWE and send out same	0.50	525.00	262.50
02-17-2025	David Klauder	B145 - Fee/Employment Applications - Retained Professionals Review Cole Schotz response to fee issues raised and email reply	0.30	525.00	157.50
02-21-2025	David Klauder	B145 - Fee/Employment Applications - Retained Professionals Review status of final fee review and begin prep of final report	0.50	525.00	262.50
02-24-2025	David Klauder	B145 - Fee/Employment Applications - Retained Professionals Initial review of final report	0.20	525.00	105.00

We appreciate your business

Date	Professional	Task	Hours	Rate	Amount
02-25-2025	David Klauder	B145 - Fee/Employment Applications - Retained Professionals Review and edit final report and coordinate filing	0.90	525.00	472.50
02-25-2025	David Klauder	B145 - Fee/Employment Applications - Retained Professionals Emails with debtor's counsel re; final report	0.10	525.00	52.50
02-28-2025	David Klauder	B145 - Fee/Employment Applications - Retained Professionals Review interim/final fee order and emails with debtor's counsel re: same	0.20	525.00	105.00
02-28-2025	David Klauder	B145 - Fee/Employment Applications - Retained Professionals Review revised fee order	0.10	525.00	52.50
03-03-2025	David Klauder	B110 - Case Administration Review agenda canceling fee hearing	0.10	525.00	52.50
03-26-2025	David Klauder	B155 - BK/Fee Examiner - Retention and Fee Applications Initial prep of BK and FE final fee apps, discuss same with BK and Legal Decoder teams	0.50	525.00	262.50
03-27-2025	David Klauder	B155 - BK/Fee Examiner - Retention and Fee Applications Review and edit BK and fee examiner final fee apps	1.00	525.00	525.00
03-28-2025	David Klauder	B155 - BK/Fee Examiner - Retention and Fee Applications Final review and editing of BK and fee examiner final fee apps	0.50	525.00	262.50
03-28-2025	David Klauder	B155 - BK/Fee Examiner - Retention and Fee Applications Emails with debtor's counsel re: filing of final fee apps	0.20	525.00	105.00
Total					16,695.00

Time Summary

Professional	Hours	Amount
David Klauder	31.80	16,695.00
Total		16,695.00
Task	Hours	Amount
B110 - Case Administration	0.60	315.00
B145 - Fee/Employment Applications - Retained Professionals	28.10	14,752.50
B155 - BK/Fee Examiner - Retention and Fee Applications	3.10	1,627.50
Total Fees		16,695.00

Total for this Invoice 16,695.00

We appreciate your business