

In re: Vyair Medical, Inc., et al.



Exhibit A1: Time Detail

Berkeley Research Group, LLC

For the Period 11/15/2024 through 11/27/2024

Date	Professional	Hours	Description
01. Asset Acquisition/ Disposition			
11/15/2024	R. Zaidman	0.5	Analyzed TSA related costs and offsetting receipts as forecasted by Debtors re: sales process.
11/18/2024	D. Galfus	0.6	Assessed the status of the TSA for the respective sales.
11/25/2024	D. Galfus	0.7	Reviewed the status of the TSA arrangements.
11/25/2024	R. Zaidman	0.2	Participated in call with AlixPartners (J. Amico) re: TSA.
11/25/2024	R. Zaidman	0.2	Participated in call with AlixPartners (R. Robbins) re: TSA.
11/26/2024	R. Zaidman	0.3	Corresponded with MWE (K. Going) re: TSA related matters and cost.
11/26/2024	R. Zaidman	0.1	Participated in call with AlixPartners (J. Amico) re: certain TSA obligations.
11/27/2024	R. Zaidman	1.2	Reviewed ongoing TSA related obligations for post Effective Date period.
11/27/2024	R. Zaidman	0.3	Participated in call with AlixPartners (C. Braley, J. Amico) re: certain TSA matters and wind down budget.
11/27/2024	R. Zaidman	0.2	Participated in call with MWE (K. Going) re: administrative costs, TSA, and Effective Date.
Task Code Total Hours		4.3	
05. Professional Retention/ Fee Application Preparation			
11/19/2024	M. Haverkamp	0.7	Edited October fee application.
11/19/2024	E. Degnan	0.6	Prepared October fee application.
11/20/2024	H. Henritz	1.6	Reviewed October fee application.
11/20/2024	M. Haverkamp	1.2	Edited October fee application.
11/20/2024	E. Degnan	0.7	Prepared October fee application.
11/21/2024	E. Degnan	1.4	Prepared October fee application.

Date	Professional	Hours	Description
05. Professional Retention/ Fee Application Preparation			
11/21/2024	M. Haverkamp	0.8	Edited October fee application.
11/22/2024	M. Haverkamp	0.8	Edited October fee application.
11/22/2024	E. Degnan	0.6	Prepared October fee application.
11/25/2024	M. Haverkamp	0.6	Edited October fee application.
11/25/2024	E. Degnan	0.5	Prepared files for Fee Examiner.
11/25/2024	D. Galfus	0.3	Reviewed BRG's October fee application.
11/25/2024	E. Degnan	0.1	Prepared October fee application.
11/26/2024	E. Degnan	1.8	Prepared final fee application.
Task Code Total Hours		11.7	
08. Interaction/ Meetings with Creditors/ Counsel			
11/19/2024	R. Cohen	0.2	Participated in a call with MWE (K. Going) re: case updates.
11/19/2024	R. Zaidman	0.2	Participated in call with MWE (K. Going, C. Wurzelbacher) re: administrative costs, TSA, and Effective Date.
11/25/2024	R. Zaidman	0.2	Participated in call with MWE (K. Going) re: administrative costs, TSA, and Effective Date.
11/26/2024	D. Galfus	0.4	Held call with K. Going, MWE re: certain case matters.
11/26/2024	R. Zaidman	0.4	Participated in call with MWE (K. Going, C. Wurzelbacher) re: administrative costs and Effective Date matters.
11/26/2024	R. Zaidman	0.1	Participated in call with AlixPartners (R. Robbins) re: TSA costs.
Task Code Total Hours		1.5	
11. Claim Analysis/ Accounting			
11/15/2024	R. Zaidman	1.2	Reviewed latest claims register on Omni site to determine claims pool range.
11/15/2024	R. Zaidman	0.6	Reviewed latest payments status related to 503(b)(9) claims and other cure costs re: Zoll sale.
11/18/2024	D. Galfus	1.1	Evaluated the Debtors' claims pool.
11/19/2024	D. Galfus	0.5	Evaluated the Debtors' claims pool.

Date	Professional	Hours	Description
11. Claim Analysis/ Accounting			
11/22/2024	R. Zaidman	0.6	Compared latest 503(b)(9) claims as filed as compared to payments made to date.
11/25/2024	R. Zaidman	1.3	Reviewed supporting data provided by AlixPartners (R. Robbins) re: latest administrative claims.
11/25/2024	R. Zaidman	0.7	Reviewed additional supporting data provided by AlixPartners (R. Robbins) re: 503(b)(9) claims.
Task Code Total Hours		6.0	
14. Executory Contracts/ Leases			
11/18/2024	D. Galfus	0.9	Evaluated certain executory contract issues.
11/19/2024	R. Zaidman	1.3	Reviewed certain contract settlement at the request of MWE (K. Going).
11/19/2024	R. Zaidman	0.4	Corresponded with AlixPartners (R. Robbins, J. Amico) re: payment terms of contract settlement.
11/20/2024	R. Zaidman	0.9	Reviewed additional contract settlement at the request of MWE (K. Going).
11/20/2024	R. Zaidman	0.8	Analyzed stipulations related to certain leases re: guaranties from Zoll as part of TSA.
11/20/2024	R. Zaidman	0.2	Corresponded with AlixPartners (R. Robbins, J. Amico) re: contract stipulation assumptions and payment terms.
11/22/2024	R. Zaidman	0.7	Reviewed cure cost schedules from asset transaction to determine remaining obligations.
11/25/2024	R. Zaidman	0.6	Reviewed additional supporting data provided by AlixPartners (R. Robbins) re: cure costs.
11/27/2024	D. Galfus	1.1	Evaluated certain executors contract matters impacting liquidity.
Task Code Total Hours		6.9	
18. Operating and Other Reports			
11/21/2024	R. Zaidman	1.5	Reviewed Monthly Operating Report filed by the Debtors for the month of October 2024.
11/21/2024	R. Zaidman	0.6	Compared Monthly Operating Report cash results to previous cash reporting through October 2024.
Task Code Total Hours		2.1	
19. Cash Flow/Cash Management/ Liquidity			

Date	Professional	Hours	Description
19. Cash Flow/Cash Management/ Liquidity			
11/15/2024	R. Zaidman	0.3	Corresponded with AlixPartners (R. Robbins) re: administrative costs.
11/15/2024	R. Zaidman	0.2	Corresponded with AlixPartners (J. Zermeno) re: professional fee escrow account.
11/18/2024	A. Kashanirokh	2.2	Prepared cash and liquidity report for 11/20 UCC meeting.
11/18/2024	R. Zaidman	1.6	Analyzed cash activity through November 8, 2024 as compared to budget as received from AlixPartners (J. Zermeno).
11/18/2024	R. Zaidman	1.2	Analyzed latest forecasted potential outstanding trade payables based on latest cash activity through November 8, 2024.
11/18/2024	R. Zaidman	0.5	Analyzed latest payroll disbursements to determine remaining employee related obligations re: liability reserves.
11/18/2024	R. Zaidman	0.3	Participated in call with AlixPartners (J. Zermeno, C. Chen) re: cash activity through November 8, 2024.
11/18/2024	R. Zaidman	0.2	Participated in call with AlixPartners (R. Robbins) re: administrative expenses, accounts payable.
11/19/2024	R. Zaidman	1.8	Compared holdback reserve schedule for post Effective Date period to latest payments made by Debtors.
11/19/2024	R. Zaidman	1.4	Reviewed underlying diligence file related to wind down reserve budget.
11/19/2024	D. Galfus	0.6	Reviewed certain liquidity issues.
11/20/2024	D. Galfus	0.7	Analyzed the Debtors' liquidity.
11/21/2024	D. Galfus	0.3	Evaluated the Debtors' liquidity.
11/22/2024	R. Zaidman	1.5	Analyzed previous accounts payable data provided by AlixPartners (C. Chen) in advance of call with AlixPartners on latest administrative expenses.
11/22/2024	R. Zaidman	0.3	Participated in call with AlixPartners (R. Robbins, C. Chen) re: administrative costs.
11/22/2024	R. Zaidman	0.2	Participated in call with AlixPartners (R. Robbins) re: outstanding accounts payable.
11/25/2024	R. Zaidman	1.2	Analyzed latest cash activity through November 15, 2024 as sent by AlixPartners (J. Zermeno).
11/25/2024	D. Galfus	0.7	Evaluated Effective Date issues related to liquidity.

Date	Professional	Hours	Description
19. Cash Flow/Cash Management/ Liquidity			
11/25/2024	R. Cohen	0.2	Participated in a call with AlixPartners (J. Zermeno) re: variance report for the week ended 11/15.
11/26/2024	R. Zaidman	1.2	Analyzed pro forma roll forward of cash to reserves in wind down budget.
11/26/2024	D. Galfus	0.8	Analyzed the Debtors' post sale issues impacting liquidity.
11/27/2024	R. Zaidman	0.8	Analyzed holdback reserve costs in the latest wind down budget for post Effective Date period re: cash availability.
11/27/2024	D. Galfus	0.4	Held call with K. Going, MWE re: certain liquidity matters.
Task Code Total Hours		18.6	
27. Plan of Reorganization/ Disclosure Statement			
11/15/2024	D. Galfus	0.5	Reviewed the confirmation order.
11/19/2024	D. Galfus	1.3	Reviewed issues impacting Effective Date.
11/20/2024	D. Galfus	0.8	Evaluated Effective Date issues.
11/21/2024	D. Galfus	0.4	Assessed issues impacting going effective.
11/26/2024	R. Zaidman	0.6	Reviewed conditions precedent to Effective Date as sent by AlixPartners (R. Robbins).
11/26/2024	R. Zaidman	0.4	Analyzed open items for discussion with Debtors as discussed with MWE for Plan Effective Date.
11/26/2024	R. Zaidman	0.2	Corresponded with AlixPartners (R. Robbins) re: Effective Date timing.
11/27/2024	R. Zaidman	0.8	Reviewed draft updated TSA list for Plan supplement as sent by Cole Schotz (M. Percontino).
11/27/2024	D. Galfus	0.2	Held call with the Debtors (M. Percontino Cole Schotz); (C. Braley AlixPartners) and Counsel (K. Going) re: certain liquidity matters.
11/27/2024	R. Zaidman	0.2	Participated in call with Cole Schotz (M. Percontino), AlixPartners (C. Braley, J. Amico), and MWE (K. Going) re: Effective Date matters.
Task Code Total Hours		5.4	
Total Hours		56.5	

In re: Vyaire Medical, Inc., et al.



Exhibit A2: Time Detail

Berkeley Research Group, LLC

For the Period 11/28/2024 through 1/22/2025

Date	Professional	Hours	Description
05. Professional Retention/ Fee Application Preparation			
12/2/2024	E. Degnan	1.1	Prepared final fee application.
12/2/2024	M. Haverkamp	0.5	Reviewed comments from Fee Examiner on BRG first interim fee application.
12/3/2024	E. Degnan	1.6	Prepared November fee application.
12/3/2024	M. Haverkamp	1.5	Drafted fee examiner response on first interim fee app.
12/3/2024	E. Degnan	0.9	Prepared final fee application.
12/4/2024	M. Haverkamp	1.1	Edited fee examiner response on first interim.
12/4/2024	E. Degnan	0.6	Prepared November fee application.
12/4/2024	M. Haverkamp	0.2	Corresponded with Counsel (D. Hurst) re: final fee app timing and parameters.
12/5/2024	M. Haverkamp	2.1	Updated First Interim Fee Examiner response.
12/6/2024	M. Haverkamp	0.1	Participated in call with Fee Examiner (D. Klauder) re: BRG first interim application.
12/9/2024	M. Haverkamp	0.2	Reviewed draft omnibus order on first interim fee applications.
12/10/2024	E. Degnan	0.2	Prepared November fee application.
12/11/2024	M. Haverkamp	0.1	Corresponded with Counsel (C. Wurzelbacher) re: payments on first interim fee applications.
12/16/2024	M. Haverkamp	0.8	Edited November fee application.
12/16/2024	E. Degnan	0.4	Prepared November fee application.
12/17/2024	E. Degnan	2.2	Prepared November fee application.
12/17/2024	M. Haverkamp	1.2	Edited November fee application.
12/18/2024	M. Haverkamp	0.1	Prepared final fee application.
12/20/2024	E. Degnan	0.2	Prepared November fee application.

Date	Professional	Hours	Description
05. Professional Retention/ Fee Application Preparation			
12/27/2024	E. Degnan	0.5	Prepared interim fee application.
12/30/2024	M. Haverkamp	0.3	Edited November fee application for filing.
12/30/2024	E. Degnan	0.1	Prepared November fee application.
1/7/2025	E. Degnan	1.6	Prepared final fee application.
1/13/2025	E. Degnan	2.9	Prepared final fee application.
1/13/2025	M. Haverkamp	1.3	Prepared final fee application.
1/13/2025	E. Degnan	1.0	Continued to prepare final fee application.
1/14/2025	E. Degnan	2.0	Prepared final fee application.
1/14/2025	M. Haverkamp	1.7	Edited final fee application.
1/15/2025	E. Degnan	2.9	Prepared final fee application.
1/15/2025	M. Haverkamp	2.3	Edited final fee application.
1/15/2025	E. Degnan	0.6	Continued to prepare final fee application.
1/15/2025	R. Cohen	0.3	Reviewed post confirmation detail included in BRG's final fee application.
1/16/2025	R. Cohen	1.2	Reviewed task code descriptions included in BRG's final fee application.
1/16/2025	M. Haverkamp	0.5	Edited final fee application.
1/16/2025	E. Degnan	0.3	Prepared final fee application.
1/17/2025	M. Haverkamp	0.3	Edited final fee application.
1/21/2025	E. Degnan	2.7	Prepared final fee application.
1/21/2025	M. Haverkamp	2.4	Edited final fee application.
1/21/2025	R. Zaidman	1.0	Commented on Final Fee Application.
1/21/2025	D. Galfus	0.8	Reviewed Final Fee Application.
Task Code Total Hours		41.8	
Total Hours		41.8	