

In re: Vyaire Medical, Inc., et al.

**Exhibit A: Time Detail****Berkeley Research Group, LLC**

For the Period 8/1/2024 through 8/31/2024

| Date                                      | Professional | Hours | Description                                                                                              |
|-------------------------------------------|--------------|-------|----------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------|
| <b>01. Asset Acquisition/ Disposition</b> |              |       |                                                                                                          |
| 8/1/2024                                  | E. Buthusiem | 2.0   | Reviewed bidder APAs.                                                                                    |
| 8/1/2024                                  | R. Zaidman   | 1.5   | Reviewed certain sales related agreement from PJT (D. Friesner) re: certain segment.                     |
| 8/1/2024                                  | R. Zaidman   | 1.4   | Reviewed sales related documents from PJT (D. Friesner) re: certain segment.                             |
| 8/1/2024                                  | R. Zaidman   | 1.3   | Reviewed sales related documents from PJT (D. Friesner) re: another certain segment.                     |
| 8/1/2024                                  | R. Cohen     | 0.9   | Edited report prepared by junior staff related to the Debtors' bid analysis.                             |
| 8/1/2024                                  | D. Galfus    | 0.7   | Evaluated the status of the sale process.                                                                |
| 8/1/2024                                  | R. Cohen     | 0.6   | Reviewed redline of revised draft APAs.                                                                  |
| 8/1/2024                                  | D. Galfus    | 0.5   | Reviewed draft APA from sale process.                                                                    |
| 8/1/2024                                  | R. Zaidman   | 0.2   | Corresponded with PJT (D. Friesner) re: sales process.                                                   |
| 8/2/2024                                  | R. Cohen     | 2.0   | Reviewed latest drafts of APAs for the Respiratory Diagnostics and Vents businesses.                     |
| 8/2/2024                                  | E. Buthusiem | 1.8   | Reviewed APA agreements.                                                                                 |
| 8/2/2024                                  | R. Cohen     | 1.6   | Reviewed report prepared by junior staff related to status of sale process.                              |
| 8/2/2024                                  | R. Zaidman   | 1.1   | Reviewed certain liability expenses at non Debtor entities re: sales process.                            |
| 8/2/2024                                  | R. Zaidman   | 0.8   | Reviewed BRG analysis on latest sales related information received from PJT (D. Friesner).               |
| 8/2/2024                                  | R. Zaidman   | 0.8   | Reviewed certain liability expenses at Debtor entities re: employee obligations to be assumed by buyers. |
| 8/2/2024                                  | D. Galfus    | 0.4   | Reviewed sale report for the Committee.                                                                  |
| 8/5/2024                                  | E. Buthusiem | 1.5   | Reviewed bids received by the Debtors                                                                    |

| Date                                      | Professional   | Hours | Description                                                                                                                        |
|-------------------------------------------|----------------|-------|------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------|
| <b>01. Asset Acquisition/ Disposition</b> |                |       |                                                                                                                                    |
| 8/5/2024                                  | D. Galfus      | 1.4   | Evaluated bids received by the Debtors                                                                                             |
| 8/5/2024                                  | R. Zaidman     | 0.9   | Reviewed APA for certain bidder as submitted by bid deadline.                                                                      |
| 8/5/2024                                  | R. Zaidman     | 0.8   | Analyzed certain financing documents as posted in the data room re: sales process.                                                 |
| 8/5/2024                                  | R. Cohen       | 0.8   | Analyzed revised bid analysis provided by the Debtors.                                                                             |
| 8/5/2024                                  | R. Zaidman     | 0.7   | Reviewed APA for another bidder as submitted by bid deadline.                                                                      |
| 8/6/2024                                  | J. Rogala      | 2.9   | Prepared commentary for sale process update presentation for 8/7 UCC report.                                                       |
| 8/6/2024                                  | A. Kashanirokh | 2.9   | Prepared sale process update materials for Committee presentation.                                                                 |
| 8/6/2024                                  | R. Cohen       | 2.9   | Reviewed APAs of bids received.                                                                                                    |
| 8/6/2024                                  | J. Rogala      | 2.7   | Reviewed revised APA drafts provided by Company.                                                                                   |
| 8/6/2024                                  | R. Cohen       | 2.5   | Reviewed sale process update report prepared by junior staff.                                                                      |
| 8/6/2024                                  | J. Rogala      | 2.4   | Continued to prepare commentary for sale process update presentation for 8/7 UCC report.                                           |
| 8/6/2024                                  | A. Kashanirokh | 2.3   | Continued to prepare sales process update materials for Committee presentation.                                                    |
| 8/6/2024                                  | J. Rogala      | 2.3   | Revised sale process update presentation for 8/7 UCC report to incorporate internal comments.                                      |
| 8/6/2024                                  | E. Buthusiem   | 2.0   | Reviewed APA bids.                                                                                                                 |
| 8/6/2024                                  | R. Cohen       | 1.7   | Edited sale process report for UCC based on comments from BRG team.                                                                |
| 8/6/2024                                  | R. Cohen       | 1.6   | Reviewed trial balance level detail of financials related to non Debtor entities proposed to be acquired in certain bids received. |
| 8/6/2024                                  | R. Zaidman     | 1.5   | Reviewed draft BRG reporting on sales process for the Committee.                                                                   |
| 8/6/2024                                  | R. Cohen       | 1.2   | Prepared summary of terms of a bid received for one of the Debtors' business lines.                                                |
| 8/6/2024                                  | R. Zaidman     | 1.2   | Reviewed updated draft BRG reporting on sales process for the Committee.                                                           |
| 8/6/2024                                  | R. Zaidman     | 1.1   | Analyzed additional APA sales related bid package as sent by PJT (D. Friesner).                                                    |

| Date                                      | Professional   | Hours | Description                                                                         |
|-------------------------------------------|----------------|-------|-------------------------------------------------------------------------------------|
| <b>01. Asset Acquisition/ Disposition</b> |                |       |                                                                                     |
| 8/6/2024                                  | R. Zaidman     | 0.9   | Reviewed draft BRG analysis comparing latest bids' value.                           |
| 8/6/2024                                  | R. Cohen       | 0.8   | Continued to review APAs of bids received.                                          |
| 8/6/2024                                  | R. Zaidman     | 0.7   | Analyzed certain bids' APAs received to date for certain business segment.          |
| 8/6/2024                                  | R. Zaidman     | 0.6   | Analyzed certain bid received to date for another business segment.                 |
| 8/6/2024                                  | D. Galfus      | 0.5   | Participated in a call with PJT (D. Friesner) re: the sale process.                 |
| 8/6/2024                                  | R. Zaidman     | 0.5   | Participated in call with PJT (D. Friesner) re: sales process update.               |
| 8/7/2024                                  | J. Rogala      | 2.7   | Reviewed revised APA drafts provided by Company.                                    |
| 8/7/2024                                  | R. Cohen       | 0.6   | Edited sale process report for UCC based on comments from BRG team.                 |
| 8/7/2024                                  | R. Zaidman     | 0.6   | Reviewed certain tax diligence posted in the sales data room.                       |
| 8/7/2024                                  | R. Zaidman     | 0.6   | Reviewed updated BRG reporting on sales process for the Committee.                  |
| 8/7/2024                                  | R. Zaidman     | 0.5   | Analyzed bid comparison analysis based on latest APAs received for certain segment. |
| 8/7/2024                                  | D. Galfus      | 0.5   | Evaluated the status of the sale processes.                                         |
| 8/7/2024                                  | R. Zaidman     | 0.3   | Corresponded with PJT (D. Friesner) re: sales process update.                       |
| 8/8/2024                                  | R. Zaidman     | 1.1   | Analyzed sales data room files re: cash flow by segment.                            |
| 8/9/2024                                  | A. Kashanirokh | 2.9   | Prepared presentation materials related to sale of the Debtors' business.           |
| 8/9/2024                                  | E. Buthusiem   | 2.0   | Reviewed sale related diligence materials uploaded to data room                     |
| 8/10/2024                                 | J. Rogala      | 2.6   | Reviewed revised APA drafts provided by Company.                                    |
| 8/10/2024                                 | R. Zaidman     | 0.8   | Analyzed Debtors' implied value analysis of certain bids.                           |
| 8/11/2024                                 | J. Rogala      | 2.2   | Reviewed revised APA drafts provided by Company.                                    |
| 8/11/2024                                 | D. Galfus      | 0.9   | Evaluated the sale process status and related bids.                                 |
| 8/11/2024                                 | R. Zaidman     | 0.8   | Reviewed auction related files received from Kirkland & Ellis (C. Ceresa).          |

| Date                                      | Professional | Hours | Description                                                                                                                                                              |
|-------------------------------------------|--------------|-------|--------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------|
| <b>01. Asset Acquisition/ Disposition</b> |              |       |                                                                                                                                                                          |
| 8/11/2024                                 | R. Zaidman   | 0.7   | Analyzed auction related files received from PJT (D. Friesner) re: bid comparisons.                                                                                      |
| 8/11/2024                                 | R. Zaidman   | 0.6   | Reviewed latest draft APA from bidder for certain segment.                                                                                                               |
| 8/11/2024                                 | D. Galfus    | 0.5   | Participated in a call with MWE (K. Going; M. Kandestin) re: the sale process status.                                                                                    |
| 8/11/2024                                 | D. Galfus    | 0.5   | Participated in a call with MWE (K. Going; M. Kandestin), Kirkland & Ellis (S. Toth; Y. Salloum) and PJT (D. Friesner; M. Schlappig) re: the upcoming auction for Vents. |
| 8/11/2024                                 | R. Zaidman   | 0.5   | Participated in call with MWE (K. Going, M. Kandestin) re: sales process.                                                                                                |
| 8/11/2024                                 | R. Zaidman   | 0.5   | Participated in call with MWE (K. Going; M. Kandestin), Kirkland & Ellis (S. Toth; Y. Salloum) and PJT (D. Friesner; M. Schlappig) re: latest sales process.             |
| 8/12/2024                                 | R. Zaidman   | 0.7   | Analyzed latest bid value analysis based on auction developments.                                                                                                        |
| 8/12/2024                                 | R. Zaidman   | 0.6   | Reviewed latest APA for bid from certain party heading into auction.                                                                                                     |
| 8/12/2024                                 | R. Zaidman   | 0.5   | Attended auction virtually re: certain business segment.                                                                                                                 |
| 8/12/2024                                 | R. Cohen     | 0.5   | Attended virtual auction for the Vents business.                                                                                                                         |
| 8/12/2024                                 | R. Cohen     | 0.4   | Analyzed bid comparison schedules provided by the Debtors.                                                                                                               |
| 8/12/2024                                 | R. Zaidman   | 0.3   | Corresponded with MWE (D. Hurst, K. Going) re: auction developments.                                                                                                     |
| 8/12/2024                                 | R. Zaidman   | 0.3   | Reviewed latest bid from certain party heading into auction.                                                                                                             |
| 8/12/2024                                 | R. Zaidman   | 0.2   | Attended continued portion of auction virtually re: certain business segment.                                                                                            |
| 8/12/2024                                 | R. Zaidman   | 0.2   | Participated in call with AlixPartners (C. Braley) re: auction / latest activity.                                                                                        |
| 8/13/2024                                 | D. Galfus    | 1.5   | Attended (telephonically) the sale process auction.                                                                                                                      |
| 8/13/2024                                 | R. Cohen     | 1.5   | Attended continuation of virtual auction for the Vents business.                                                                                                         |
| 8/13/2024                                 | R. Zaidman   | 1.5   | Attended continued portion of auction virtually re: certain business segment.                                                                                            |
| 8/13/2024                                 | R. Zaidman   | 0.6   | Analyzed updated bid comparison from AlixPartners (J. Zermeno).                                                                                                          |

| Date                                      | Professional | Hours | Description                                                                                             |
|-------------------------------------------|--------------|-------|---------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------|
| <b>01. Asset Acquisition/ Disposition</b> |              |       |                                                                                                         |
| 8/13/2024                                 | R. Zaidman   | 0.6   | Reviewed additional bid value comparison for certain bid from AlixPartners (J. Zermeno).                |
| 8/13/2024                                 | R. Zaidman   | 0.5   | Corresponded with MWE (D. Hurst, K. Going) re: auction developments.                                    |
| 8/13/2024                                 | R. Zaidman   | 0.5   | Reviewed bid value comparison for certain bid from AlixPartners (J. Zermeno).                           |
| 8/13/2024                                 | R. Cohen     | 0.4   | Reviewed bid comparisons provided by the Debtors.                                                       |
| 8/13/2024                                 | R. Zaidman   | 0.2   | Participated in call with AlixPartners (C. Braley) re: auction / latest activity.                       |
| 8/13/2024                                 | R. Cohen     | 0.1   | Attended continuation of virtual auction for the Vents business.                                        |
| 8/13/2024                                 | R. Cohen     | 0.1   | Attended continuation of virtual auction for the Vents business.                                        |
| 8/13/2024                                 | R. Cohen     | 0.1   | Attended continuation of virtual auction for the Vents business.                                        |
| 8/13/2024                                 | R. Cohen     | 0.1   | Attended continuation of virtual auction for the Vents business.                                        |
| 8/13/2024                                 | R. Zaidman   | 0.1   | Attended continued portion of auction virtually re: certain business segment.                           |
| 8/13/2024                                 | R. Zaidman   | 0.1   | Attended continued portion of auction virtually re: certain business segment.                           |
| 8/13/2024                                 | R. Zaidman   | 0.1   | Attended continued portion of auction virtually re: certain business segment.                           |
| 8/13/2024                                 | R. Zaidman   | 0.1   | Attended continued portion of auction virtually re: certain business segment.                           |
| 8/13/2024                                 | R. Zaidman   | 0.1   | Attended continued portion of auction virtually re: certain business segment.                           |
| 8/13/2024                                 | R. Cohen     | 0.1   | Attended virtual auction for the Vents business.                                                        |
| 8/13/2024                                 | R. Zaidman   | 0.1   | Participated in additional call with AlixPartners (C. Braley) re: auction / latest activity.            |
| 8/13/2024                                 | R. Zaidman   | 0.1   | Participated in additional call with AlixPartners (C. Braley) re: post auction round / latest activity. |
| 8/14/2024                                 | J. Rogala    | 2.3   | Prepared executive summary for sale process update UCC report.                                          |
| 8/14/2024                                 | R. Zaidman   | 1.1   | Attended continued portion of auction virtually re: certain business segment.                           |

| Date                                      | Professional   | Hours | Description                                                                                                |
|-------------------------------------------|----------------|-------|------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------|
| <b>01. Asset Acquisition/ Disposition</b> |                |       |                                                                                                            |
| 8/14/2024                                 | D. Galfus      | 0.9   | Attended (telephonically) a portion of the sale process auction.                                           |
| 8/14/2024                                 | R. Zaidman     | 0.8   | Prepared summary correspondence for MWE team re: business segment auction.                                 |
| 8/14/2024                                 | D. Galfus      | 0.6   | Reviewed the Debtors' sale process.                                                                        |
| 8/14/2024                                 | R. Zaidman     | 0.4   | Analyzed schedule sent by AlixPartners (J. Zermeno) re: value assessment of certain bid in sales auction.  |
| 8/14/2024                                 | R. Zaidman     | 0.3   | Corresponded with MWE (D. Hurst, K. Going) re: auction developments.                                       |
| 8/15/2024                                 | R. Zaidman     | 1.1   | Reviewed filed APA for Vents auction successful bidder as filed with the Bankruptcy Court.                 |
| 8/15/2024                                 | R. Zaidman     | 0.7   | Reviewed most recent APA from certain bidder for certain business segment.                                 |
| 8/15/2024                                 | R. Zaidman     | 0.7   | Reviewed summary schedule from AlixPartners (J. Zermeno) re: successful bid value.                         |
| 8/15/2024                                 | R. Zaidman     | 0.6   | Corresponded with MWE (K. Going, D. Azman, D. Hurst) re: status of sale hearing, other sale related items. |
| 8/15/2024                                 | R. Zaidman     | 0.4   | Participated in call with PJT (D. Friesner) re: sales process of certain segment.                          |
| 8/15/2024                                 | R. Zaidman     | 0.3   | Participated in call with MWE (K. Going) re: sales hearing, sales process matters.                         |
| 8/15/2024                                 | R. Zaidman     | 0.3   | Reviewed correspondence from MWE (K. Going) re: status of sale related items.                              |
| 8/15/2024                                 | R. Zaidman     | 0.1   | Participated in call with AlixPartners (J. Zermeno) re: auction results.                                   |
| 8/16/2024                                 | R. Zaidman     | 1.3   | Reviewed latest APA from certain bidder for certain segment.                                               |
| 8/16/2024                                 | R. Zaidman     | 1.1   | Reviewed potential assumed liabilities based on latest potential sales process outlook.                    |
| 8/16/2024                                 | R. Cohen       | 0.9   | Reviewed draft of APA related to an asset sale.                                                            |
| 8/19/2024                                 | R. Cohen       | 1.4   | Reviewed notice of successful bidder filed by the Debtors.                                                 |
| 8/19/2024                                 | R. Zaidman     | 1.1   | Analyzed bid summary for Vents business as provided by AlixPartners (M. Del Priore).                       |
| 8/19/2024                                 | A. Kashanirokh | 1.1   | Developed an updated sales process analysis on certain bidders.                                            |

| Date                                      | Professional   | Hours | Description                                                                                    |
|-------------------------------------------|----------------|-------|------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------|
| <b>01. Asset Acquisition/ Disposition</b> |                |       |                                                                                                |
| 8/19/2024                                 | R. Cohen       | 1.0   | Analyzed bid analysis provided by the Debtors based on filed Zoll APA.                         |
| 8/19/2024                                 | D. Galfus      | 0.3   | Evaluated the status of the sale process.                                                      |
| 8/20/2024                                 | A. Kashanirokh | 2.7   | Edited sales presentation.                                                                     |
| 8/20/2024                                 | R. Cohen       | 1.3   | Edited sale process report for UCC prepared by junior staff (reflecting updates through 8/20). |
| 8/20/2024                                 | R. Cohen       | 1.3   | Reviewed draft of Zoll's APA for the Vents business.                                           |
| 8/20/2024                                 | R. Zaidman     | 1.2   | Analyzed latest draft APA of successful bidder re: Vents segment.                              |
| 8/20/2024                                 | R. Cohen       | 1.1   | Reviewed draft of APA related to Respiratory Diagnostics asset sale.                           |
| 8/20/2024                                 | R. Zaidman     | 0.8   | Reviewed draft APA for certain segment from MWE (B. Hadler).                                   |
| 8/20/2024                                 | R. Zaidman     | 0.8   | Reviewed draft BRG reporting re: sales process, bids.                                          |
| 8/20/2024                                 | D. Galfus      | 0.6   | Reviewed BRG's reporting on the sale status.                                                   |
| 8/20/2024                                 | R. Zaidman     | 0.5   | Reviewed draft contract assumptions schedule re: Vents segment.                                |
| 8/20/2024                                 | R. Zaidman     | 0.3   | Corresponded with PJT (D. Friesner) re: update on sales process.                               |
| 8/20/2024                                 | R. Zaidman     | 0.3   | Reviewed draft schedule for APA for certain segment from MWE (B. Hadler).                      |
| 8/20/2024                                 | R. Zaidman     | 0.2   | Participated in call with PJT (M. Schlappig, D. Friesner) re: sales process status.            |
| 8/21/2024                                 | R. Cohen       | 2.9   | Analyzed summary of Zoll's bid prepared by the Debtors.                                        |
| 8/21/2024                                 | A. Kashanirokh | 2.4   | Drafted presentation materials related to recent successful bidder's purchase agreement.       |
| 8/21/2024                                 | R. Zaidman     | 1.6   | Reviewed Trudell's APA filed by the Debtors re: Respiratory Diagnostics business.              |
| 8/21/2024                                 | R. Cohen       | 1.1   | Continued to analyze summary of Zoll's bid prepared by the Debtors.                            |
| 8/21/2024                                 | R. Cohen       | 1.0   | Reviewed Trudell APA for the Respiratory Diagnostics business filed with the Court.            |
| 8/21/2024                                 | D. Galfus      | 0.6   | Evaluated next steps in the sale process.                                                      |
| 8/21/2024                                 | R. Zaidman     | 0.6   | Reviewed status of certain regulatory matters re: sales process.                               |

| Date                                      | Professional | Hours | Description                                                                                                   |
|-------------------------------------------|--------------|-------|---------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------|
| <b>01. Asset Acquisition/ Disposition</b> |              |       |                                                                                                               |
| 8/21/2024                                 | R. Zaidman   | 0.3   | Corresponded with PJT (D. Friesner) re: status of sales proceeds.                                             |
| 8/22/2024                                 | D. Galfus    | 0.9   | Reviewed the reservation of rights draft re: sale motion.                                                     |
| 8/22/2024                                 | R. Cohen     | 0.6   | Reviewed draft of a document prepared by MWE related to the sale transactions.                                |
| 8/22/2024                                 | R. Zaidman   | 0.6   | Reviewed draft UCC reservation of rights from MWE (C. Wurzelbacher) re: sales hearing.                        |
| 8/22/2024                                 | R. Zaidman   | 0.5   | Reviewed correspondence from PJT (D. Friesner) re: sales process update.                                      |
| 8/22/2024                                 | R. Cohen     | 0.4   | Prepared summary schedule related to sale process.                                                            |
| 8/22/2024                                 | R. Zaidman   | 0.4   | Reviewed updated draft UCC reservation of rights from MWE (C. Wurzelbacher) re: sales hearing.                |
| 8/22/2024                                 | R. Zaidman   | 0.3   | Corresponded with MWE team (C. Wurzelbacher) re: sale process.                                                |
| 8/23/2024                                 | R. Zaidman   | 2.1   | Reviewed certain draft disclosure schedules provided by Debtors related to Vents transaction.                 |
| 8/23/2024                                 | R. Cohen     | 0.7   | Prepared summary schedule related to sale process.                                                            |
| 8/25/2024                                 | R. Cohen     | 0.3   | Prepared summary of cure costs to be paid by the buyers.                                                      |
| 8/26/2024                                 | D. Galfus    | 0.2   | Held a call with MWE (K. Going) re: sale hearing.                                                             |
| 8/26/2024                                 | R. Zaidman   | 0.1   | Participated in call with MWE (K. Going) re: sales hearing status.                                            |
| 8/27/2024                                 | R. Zaidman   | 1.3   | Analyzed latest contract assumption schedule as filed with the Bankruptcy Court.                              |
| 8/27/2024                                 | R. Zaidman   | 1.1   | Participated in call with MWE (K. Going, M. Kandestin) re: sales hearing issues.                              |
| 8/27/2024                                 | D. Galfus    | 0.4   | Participated in a portion of a call with MWE (K. Going) re: sale hearing.                                     |
| 8/27/2024                                 | R. Zaidman   | 0.2   | Participated in call with AlixPartners (R. Robbins) re: cure costs.                                           |
| 8/28/2024                                 | J. Rogala    | 2.6   | Reviewed revised APAs provided by Debtors' counsel.                                                           |
| 8/28/2024                                 | D. Galfus    | 1.5   | Reviewed the draft sale objections.                                                                           |
| 8/28/2024                                 | R. Cohen     | 1.3   | Reviewed documents provided by the Debtors related to TSA costs.                                              |
| 8/28/2024                                 | D. Galfus    | 1.1   | Participated in a call with the Committee and Counsel (K. Going; M. Kandestin) re: the upcoming sale hearing. |

| Date                                                           | Professional | Hours        | Description                                                                                     |
|----------------------------------------------------------------|--------------|--------------|-------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------|
| <b>01. Asset Acquisition/ Disposition</b>                      |              |              |                                                                                                 |
| 8/28/2024                                                      | R. Cohen     | 0.8          | Reviewed draft of Committee's supplemental reservation of rights.                               |
| 8/28/2024                                                      | R. Zaidman   | 0.7          | Reviewed revised sale order for Zoll as filed with the Bankruptcy Court.                        |
| 8/28/2024                                                      | D. Galfus    | 0.6          | Held call with C. Wurzelbacher (MWE) re: the sale objection.                                    |
| 8/28/2024                                                      | R. Cohen     | 0.6          | Participated in a call with MWE (C. Wurzelbacher) re: sale objection.                           |
| 8/28/2024                                                      | R. Zaidman   | 0.6          | Reviewed draft UCC supplemental reservation of rights as sent by MWE (C. Wurzelbacher).         |
| 8/28/2024                                                      | R. Zaidman   | 0.6          | Reviewed revised sale order for Trudell as filed with the Bankruptcy Court.                     |
| 8/28/2024                                                      | R. Zaidman   | 0.5          | Analyzed diligence files provided by AlixPartners (J. Amico) re: transition services.           |
| 8/28/2024                                                      | D. Galfus    | 0.2          | Held call with M. Kandestin, MWE re: the upcoming sale hearing.                                 |
| 8/29/2024                                                      | D. Galfus    | 2.3          | Reviewed the UCC's sale objection and related matters.                                          |
| 8/29/2024                                                      | D. Galfus    | 1.0          | Held call with K. Reagan, MWE regarding preparation for the sale objection.                     |
| 8/29/2024                                                      | R. Cohen     | 1.0          | Participated in a call with MWE (K. Regan) re: preparation for sale hearing/objection.          |
| 8/29/2024                                                      | R. Zaidman   | 0.7          | Reviewed BRG summary to send to MWE (M. Kandestin, K. Regan) re: sales hearing preparation.     |
| 8/29/2024                                                      | D. Galfus    | 0.6          | Held call with C. Braley, AlixPartners re: the upcoming sale hearing.                           |
| 8/29/2024                                                      | R. Cohen     | 0.6          | Reviewed revised supplemental reservation of rights prepared by MWE.                            |
| 8/29/2024                                                      | R. Zaidman   | 0.4          | Reviewed updated draft UCC supplemental reservation of rights as sent by MWE (C. Wurzelbacher). |
| 8/29/2024                                                      | D. Galfus    | 0.1          | Held call with D. Azman, MWE re: sale objection.                                                |
| 8/29/2024                                                      | D. Galfus    | 0.1          | Held call with M. Kandestin, MWE re: the upcoming sale hearing.                                 |
| 8/30/2024                                                      | D. Galfus    | 1.5          | Reviewed sale related documents prior to sale hearing                                           |
| 8/30/2024                                                      | R. Zaidman   | 0.8          | Reviewed summary of sales hearing update from BRG staff.                                        |
| <b>Task Code Total Hours</b>                                   |              | <b>164.2</b> |                                                                                                 |
| <b>05. Professional Retention/ Fee Application Preparation</b> |              |              |                                                                                                 |

| Date | Professional | Hours | Description |
|------|--------------|-------|-------------|
|------|--------------|-------|-------------|

**05. Professional Retention/ Fee Application Preparation**

|           |              |     |                                                 |
|-----------|--------------|-----|-------------------------------------------------|
| 8/9/2024  | E. Degnan    | 1.5 | Prepared June/July fee application.             |
| 8/12/2024 | E. Degnan    | 2.0 | Prepared June/July fee application.             |
| 8/13/2024 | E. Degnan    | 1.8 | Prepared June/July fee application.             |
| 8/15/2024 | E. Degnan    | 0.8 | Prepared June/July fee application.             |
| 8/19/2024 | E. Degnan    | 1.8 | Prepared June/July fee application.             |
| 8/20/2024 | M. Haverkamp | 2.7 | Edited first monthly fee application.           |
| 8/20/2024 | M. Haverkamp | 0.4 | Edited first monthly fee application.           |
| 8/20/2024 | E. Degnan    | 0.4 | Prepared June/July fee application.             |
| 8/21/2024 | E. Degnan    | 0.5 | Prepared July fee application.                  |
| 8/22/2024 | E. Degnan    | 0.5 | Integrated edits for June/July fee application. |
| 8/23/2024 | E. Degnan    | 0.5 | Prepared June/July fee application.             |
| 8/23/2024 | M. Haverkamp | 0.2 | Edited first monthly fee application.           |
| 8/26/2024 | M. Haverkamp | 1.1 | Edited first monthly fee application.           |
| 8/30/2024 | E. Degnan    | 1.0 | Prepared June/July fee application.             |

|                              |             |
|------------------------------|-------------|
| <b>Task Code Total Hours</b> | <b>15.2</b> |
|------------------------------|-------------|

**06. Attend Hearings/ Related Activities**

|           |            |     |                                                                                             |
|-----------|------------|-----|---------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------|
| 8/26/2024 | D. Galfus  | 0.5 | Attended (telephonically) the sale hearing.                                                 |
| 8/26/2024 | R. Zaidman | 0.5 | Attended (virtual) Court hearing re: status conference and sales hearing.                   |
| 8/29/2024 | R. Cohen   | 2.9 | Prepared outline for UCC Counsel's cross examination of C. Braley during 8/30 sale hearing. |
| 8/30/2024 | D. Galfus  | 2.9 | Attended (telephonically) the sale hearing.                                                 |
| 8/30/2024 | R. Cohen   | 2.8 | Attended portion of sale hearing virtually.                                                 |
| 8/30/2024 | D. Galfus  | 0.1 | Continued to attend (telephonically) the sale hearing.                                      |

|                              |            |
|------------------------------|------------|
| <b>Task Code Total Hours</b> | <b>9.7</b> |
|------------------------------|------------|

**07. Interaction/ Meetings with Debtors/ Counsel**

| Date                                                     | Professional | Hours      | Description                                                                                                                                                                                              |
|----------------------------------------------------------|--------------|------------|----------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------|
| <b>07. Interaction/ Meetings with Debtors/ Counsel</b>   |              |            |                                                                                                                                                                                                          |
| 8/2/2024                                                 | R. Zaidman   | 0.2        | Participated in call with AlixPartners (J. Zermeno) re: DIP funding and sales process analysis.                                                                                                          |
| 8/26/2024                                                | D. Galfus    | 1.2        | Participated in a call with the Debtors' advisors from AlixPartners (C. Braley), Kirkland & Ellis (S. Winters) and PJT and MWE (K. Going) re: the rescheduled hearing on the sale motion and next steps. |
| 8/26/2024                                                | R. Zaidman   | 1.2        | Participated in call with Kirkland & Ellis (S. Winters), AlixPartners (C. Braley, J. Amico), PJT (D. Friesner, M. Schlappig), MWE (K. Going, M. Kandestin) re: sale hearing.                             |
| <b>Task Code Total Hours</b>                             |              | <b>2.6</b> |                                                                                                                                                                                                          |
| <b>08. Interaction/ Meetings with Creditors/ Counsel</b> |              |            |                                                                                                                                                                                                          |
| 8/6/2024                                                 | D. Galfus    | 1.0        | Participated in a call with MWE (K. Going, M. Kandestin) re: the sale process and the upcoming Committee call.                                                                                           |
| 8/6/2024                                                 | R. Zaidman   | 1.0        | Participated in call with MWE (K. Going, M. Kandestin) re: case status and sales process.                                                                                                                |
| 8/7/2024                                                 | D. Galfus    | 1.0        | Participated in a call with the Committee and MWE (K. Going; M. Kandestin) re: the sale process and operations.                                                                                          |
| 8/7/2024                                                 | R. Zaidman   | 1.0        | Participated in call with Committee and MWE team (K. Going, M. Kandestin) re: latest case developments.                                                                                                  |
| 8/13/2024                                                | R. Zaidman   | 0.4        | Participated in call with MWE (K. Going, R. Trickey) re: case status, sales process.                                                                                                                     |
| 8/19/2024                                                | R. Zaidman   | 0.3        | Corresponded with MWE team (K. Going, D. Azman) re: latest case issues, next steps, sales process.                                                                                                       |
| 8/20/2024                                                | D. Galfus    | 0.6        | Participated in a call with Counsel (D. Azman, K. Going) in preparation of the upcoming Committee call.                                                                                                  |
| 8/20/2024                                                | R. Zaidman   | 0.6        | Participated in call with MWE (D. Azman, K. Going) re: sales process, DIP, case timeline, other UCC work streams.                                                                                        |
| 8/21/2024                                                | D. Galfus    | 1.0        | Participated in a call with Counsel (K. Going, M. Kandestin) and the Committee re: sale process and other case matters.                                                                                  |
| 8/21/2024                                                | R. Zaidman   | 1.0        | Participated in call with Committee and MWE team (K. Going, M. Kandestin) re: latest case developments.                                                                                                  |
| 8/25/2024                                                | R. Zaidman   | 0.2        | Participated in call with MWE (M. Kandestin) re: sales hearing, liquidity matters.                                                                                                                       |
| 8/26/2024                                                | D. Galfus    | 0.7        | Participated in a call with MWE (K. Going, D. Azman, M. Kandestin) re: delayed hearing and next steps.                                                                                                   |

| Date                                                     | Professional   | Hours       | Description                                                                                                        |
|----------------------------------------------------------|----------------|-------------|--------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------|
| <b>08. Interaction/ Meetings with Creditors/ Counsel</b> |                |             |                                                                                                                    |
| 8/26/2024                                                | R. Zaidman     | 0.7         | Participated in call with MWE (K. Going, D. Azman, M. Kandestin) re: post call after call with Debtors' advisors.  |
| 8/26/2024                                                | D. Galfus      | 0.2         | Held a follow up call with K. Going, MWE re: next steps and sale motion.                                           |
| 8/26/2024                                                | R. Zaidman     | 0.2         | Participated in call with MWE (K. Going) re: sales hearing and latest status of liquidity forecast.                |
| 8/26/2024                                                | R. Zaidman     | 0.2         | Participated in call with MWE (K. Going, M. Kandestin) re: post sale hearing status.                               |
| 8/27/2024                                                | D. Galfus      | 1.1         | Participated in a call with MWE (K. Going; M. Kandestin; D. Azman) in preparation for the upcoming Committee call. |
| 8/27/2024                                                | R. Cohen       | 1.1         | Participated in a call with MWE (K. Going; M. Kandestin; D. Azman) re: 8/28 Committee call agenda.                 |
| 8/28/2024                                                | R. Cohen       | 1.1         | Participated in UCC call with MWE (K. Going; M. Kandestin) re: sale update.                                        |
| 8/28/2024                                                | D. Galfus      | 0.8         | Participated in a call with Counsel (K. Going; M. Kandestin) in preparation for the Committee call.                |
| <b>Task Code Total Hours</b>                             |                | <b>14.2</b> |                                                                                                                    |
| <b>11. Claim Analysis/ Accounting</b>                    |                |             |                                                                                                                    |
| 8/7/2024                                                 | A. Kashanirokh | 2.9         | Continued to prepare schedule summarizing claims analysis.                                                         |
| 8/7/2024                                                 | J. Rogala      | 2.9         | Continued to prepare summary of unsecured claims from claims register.                                             |
| 8/7/2024                                                 | A. Kashanirokh | 2.9         | Prepared schedule summarizing claims analysis.                                                                     |
| 8/7/2024                                                 | J. Rogala      | 2.9         | Prepared summary of unsecured claims from claims register.                                                         |
| 8/7/2024                                                 | A. Kashanirokh | 2.4         | Continued to prepare schedule summarizing claims analysis.                                                         |
| 8/7/2024                                                 | R. Cohen       | 0.9         | Reviewed latest claims register.                                                                                   |
| 8/15/2024                                                | R. Zaidman     | 0.8         | Analyzed potential unsecured claims pool based on claims register data.                                            |
| 8/16/2024                                                | R. Zaidman     | 0.8         | Analyzed potential unsecured claims pool categories based on latest sales process outlook.                         |
| <b>Task Code Total Hours</b>                             |                | <b>16.5</b> |                                                                                                                    |
| <b>17. Analysis of Historical Results</b>                |                |             |                                                                                                                    |

| Date                                      | Professional   | Hours       | Description                                                                                      |
|-------------------------------------------|----------------|-------------|--------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------|
| <b>17. Analysis of Historical Results</b> |                |             |                                                                                                  |
| 8/1/2024                                  | A. Kashanirokh | 2.9         | Continued to prepare non Debtor analysis presentation.                                           |
| 8/1/2024                                  | A. Kashanirokh | 2.9         | Prepared non Debtor analysis presentation representing key findings.                             |
| 8/1/2024                                  | J. Rogala      | 2.8         | Provided comments on non Debtor analysis.                                                        |
| 8/1/2024                                  | A. Kashanirokh | 2.7         | Continued to prepare non Debtor analysis presentation.                                           |
| 8/1/2024                                  | J. Rogala      | 1.9         | Prepared non Debtor analysis executive summary.                                                  |
| 8/2/2024                                  | J. Rogala      | 2.9         | Revised non Debtor analysis to incorporate internal comments.                                    |
| 8/2/2024                                  | A. Kashanirokh | 2.8         | Edited non Debtor analysis presentation based on comments from BRG team.                         |
| 8/2/2024                                  | A. Kashanirokh | 2.6         | Continued to edit non Debtor analysis presentation based on comments from BRG team.              |
| 8/2/2024                                  | A. Kashanirokh | 2.5         | Continued to edit non Debtor analysis presentation based on comments from BRG team.              |
| 8/2/2024                                  | J. Rogala      | 2.1         | Prepared commentary for non Debtor analysis.                                                     |
| 8/2/2024                                  | J. Rogala      | 1.8         | Provided comments on non Debtor analysis.                                                        |
| 8/2/2024                                  | R. Cohen       | 1.0         | Reviewed report prepared by junior staff related to non Debtor financials.                       |
| 8/4/2024                                  | E. Buthusiem   | 2.0         | Reviewed financial documents uploaded to the data room                                           |
| 8/5/2024                                  | A. Kashanirokh | 2.7         | Revised non Debtor financials overview presentation based on comments from BRG team.             |
| 8/5/2024                                  | A. Kashanirokh | 1.5         | Continued to revise non Debtor financials overview presentation based on comments from BRG team. |
| 8/5/2024                                  | R. Zaidman     | 1.4         | Reviewed intercompany balances as of May 2024 between Debtor and non Debtor entities.            |
| 8/14/2024                                 | E. Buthusiem   | 1.0         | Reviewed Debtors' financials.                                                                    |
| <b>Task Code Total Hours</b>              |                | <b>37.5</b> |                                                                                                  |
| <b>18. Operating and Other Reports</b>    |                |             |                                                                                                  |
| 8/5/2024                                  | A. Kashanirokh | 2.7         | Prepared UCC report based on findings from AlixPartners.                                         |
| 8/6/2024                                  | A. Kashanirokh | 2.9         | Revised UCC report based on comments from BRG team.                                              |

| Date                                            | Professional   | Hours       | Description                                                                                                 |
|-------------------------------------------------|----------------|-------------|-------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------|
| <b>18. Operating and Other Reports</b>          |                |             |                                                                                                             |
| 8/6/2024                                        | D. Galfus      | 1.4         | Reviewed the Committee presentation on the liquidity and sale process.                                      |
| 8/12/2024                                       | J. Rogala      | 2.7         | Revised 8/14 UCC report to incorporate internal comments.                                                   |
| 8/22/2024                                       | R. Zaidman     | 1.8         | Reviewed Monthly Operating Reports by entity filed by the Debtors for the month of July 2024.               |
| 8/26/2024                                       | R. Zaidman     | 0.5         | Reviewed Debtors' monthly reporting on critical vendor spend through July 2024.                             |
| 8/30/2024                                       | A. Kashanirokh | 1.7         | Developed schedule of post petition payables related to Debtors' July Monthly Operating Report.             |
| <b>Task Code Total Hours</b>                    |                | <b>13.7</b> |                                                                                                             |
| <b>19. Cash Flow/Cash Management/ Liquidity</b> |                |             |                                                                                                             |
| 8/1/2024                                        | J. Rogala      | 2.9         | Prepared revised wind down analysis using information from updated APAs.                                    |
| 8/1/2024                                        | J. Rogala      | 1.8         | Continued to prepare revised wind down analysis using information from updated APAs.                        |
| 8/1/2024                                        | R. Zaidman     | 0.2         | Reviewed latest correspondence from AlixPartners (M. Del Priore) re: DIP funding.                           |
| 8/2/2024                                        | R. Zaidman     | 0.8         | Analyzed latest DIP reporting package from AlixPartners (J. Zermeno) through July 26, 2024.                 |
| 8/2/2024                                        | R. Zaidman     | 0.7         | Analyzed DIP budget upcoming weeks' forecast based on latest activity through July 26, 2024.                |
| 8/2/2024                                        | D. Galfus      | 0.5         | Analyzed the Debtors' liquidity needs as of 7/26.                                                           |
| 8/4/2024                                        | J. Rogala      | 1.2         | Reviewed liquidity package from Debtors advisors with week ended 7/26 data.                                 |
| 8/5/2024                                        | J. Rogala      | 2.7         | Prepared commentary for 8/7 liquidity UCC report.                                                           |
| 8/5/2024                                        | J. Rogala      | 2.6         | Revised 8/7 liquidity UCC report to incorporate internal comments.                                          |
| 8/5/2024                                        | J. Rogala      | 2.5         | Continued to prepare commentary for 8/7 liquidity UCC report.                                               |
| 8/5/2024                                        | A. Kashanirokh | 1.3         | Prepared weekly cash update for 8/7 UCC report.                                                             |
| 8/5/2024                                        | R. Zaidman     | 1.1         | Reviewed detailed support for cash activity through July 26, 2024 as provided by AlixPartners (J. Zermeno). |
| 8/5/2024                                        | D. Galfus      | 0.6         | Analyzed the Debtors' variance report for the week ended 7/26.                                              |

| Date                                            | Professional   | Hours | Description                                                                                                                        |
|-------------------------------------------------|----------------|-------|------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------|
| <b>19. Cash Flow/Cash Management/ Liquidity</b> |                |       |                                                                                                                                    |
| 8/5/2024                                        | R. Zaidman     | 0.6   | Participated in call with AlixPartners (M. Del Priore, J. Zermeno) re: variance reporting through July 26, 2024.                   |
| 8/5/2024                                        | R. Cohen       | 0.6   | Reviewed variance report for the week ended 7/26.                                                                                  |
| 8/5/2024                                        | R. Cohen       | 0.5   | Participated in call with AlixPartners (J. Zermeno, M. Del Priore) re: variance report for the week ended 7/26.                    |
| 8/6/2024                                        | R. Cohen       | 1.4   | Reviewed draft liquidity report prepared by junior staff re: variance report for the week ended 7/26.                              |
| 8/6/2024                                        | R. Zaidman     | 1.1   | Analyzed BRG draft reporting on liquidity through July 26, 2024.                                                                   |
| 8/7/2024                                        | R. Zaidman     | 0.3   | Corresponded with AlixPartners (M. Del Priore, J. Zermeno) re: DIP and liquidity update.                                           |
| 8/9/2024                                        | A. Kashanirokh | 1.0   | Reviewed weekly cash and liquidity documents related to 8/7 UCC report.                                                            |
| 8/9/2024                                        | R. Zaidman     | 0.7   | Analyzed latest cash reporting through August 2, 2024 from AlixPartners (J. Zermeno).                                              |
| 8/12/2024                                       | J. Rogala      | 2.9   | Prepared commentary for 8.14 UCC liquidity report.                                                                                 |
| 8/12/2024                                       | R. Zaidman     | 0.9   | Reviewed latest draft BRG analysis of cash activity through August 2, 2024.                                                        |
| 8/12/2024                                       | R. Zaidman     | 0.6   | Analyzed latest cash requirements based on latest cash activity through August 2, 2024.                                            |
| 8/13/2024                                       | J. Rogala      | 1.8   | Revised 8.14 UCC liquidity report to incorporate internal comments.                                                                |
| 8/13/2024                                       | R. Zaidman     | 1.3   | Analyzed BRG draft cash activity analysis through August 2, 2024.                                                                  |
| 8/13/2024                                       | R. Cohen       | 0.4   | Edited DIP and liquidity report related to variance report for the week ended 8/2 based on information received from AlixPartners. |
| 8/14/2024                                       | R. Zaidman     | 0.7   | Reviewed latest BRG reporting on cash activity through August 2, 2024 to send to the Committee.                                    |
| 8/16/2024                                       | R. Zaidman     | 1.2   | Analyzed latest DIP reporting package from AlixPartners (J. Zermeno) re: results through August 9, 2024.                           |
| 8/16/2024                                       | R. Cohen       | 0.4   | Reviewed variance report for the week ending 8/9.                                                                                  |
| 8/18/2024                                       | R. Cohen       | 0.5   | Reviewed draft of DIP and liquidity report prepared by junior staff re: variance report for the week ended 8/9.                    |
| 8/19/2024                                       | A. Kashanirokh | 2.7   | Prepared presentation materials for 8/7 Committee report based on cash and liquidity documents found in data room.                 |

| Date                                            | Professional   | Hours | Description                                                                                                                             |
|-------------------------------------------------|----------------|-------|-----------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------|
| <b>19. Cash Flow/Cash Management/ Liquidity</b> |                |       |                                                                                                                                         |
| 8/19/2024                                       | A. Kashanirokh | 2.6   | Revised presentation materials for 8/7 Committee report based on cash and liquidity documents found in data room.                       |
| 8/19/2024                                       | R. Zaidman     | 1.2   | Reviewed draft of BRG reporting on cash activity through August 9, 2024.                                                                |
| 8/19/2024                                       | R. Cohen       | 1.1   | Reviewed DIP and liquidity report prepared by junior staff re: variance report for the week ended 8/9.                                  |
| 8/19/2024                                       | R. Zaidman     | 0.8   | Analyzed cash forecast based on sales timeline scenarios.                                                                               |
| 8/19/2024                                       | R. Zaidman     | 0.7   | Participated in call with AlixPartners (M. Del Priore, R. Robbins-partial) re: cash activity through August 9, 2024, other case issues. |
| 8/19/2024                                       | R. Zaidman     | 0.6   | Analyzed diligence provided by AlixPartners (J. Zermeno) for cash results through August 9, 2024.                                       |
| 8/19/2024                                       | R. Cohen       | 0.5   | Participated in a portion of a call with AlixPartners (M. DelPriore, R. Robbins) re: variance report for the week ended 8/9.            |
| 8/19/2024                                       | D. Galfus      | 0.3   | Evaluated the Debtors' variance report for the week ended 8/9.                                                                          |
| 8/20/2024                                       | A. Kashanirokh | 1.1   | Modified presentation for weekly cash and liquidity presentation to reflect comments from BRG team.                                     |
| 8/20/2024                                       | R. Zaidman     | 0.7   | Reviewed updated draft of BRG reporting on cash activity through August 9, 2024.                                                        |
| 8/20/2024                                       | R. Cohen       | 0.3   | Reviewed revised DIP and liquidity report prepared by junior staff re: variance report for the week ended 8/9.                          |
| 8/22/2024                                       | R. Zaidman     | 1.2   | Analyzed potential forecast scenarios through sale closing.                                                                             |
| 8/22/2024                                       | D. Galfus      | 0.6   | Evaluated the Debtors' variance report for the week ended 8/16.                                                                         |
| 8/22/2024                                       | R. Zaidman     | 0.3   | Corresponded with AlixPartners (J. Zermeno, M. Del Priore) re: DIP funding.                                                             |
| 8/23/2024                                       | A. Kashanirokh | 2.7   | Prepared presentation materials for weekly UCC meeting based on weekly cash documents provided by AlixPartners.                         |
| 8/23/2024                                       | R. Zaidman     | 1.2   | Analyzed DIP reporting package from AlixPartners (J. Zermeno) re: cash results through August 16, 2024.                                 |
| 8/23/2024                                       | R. Zaidman     | 1.1   | Analyzed potential forecast scenarios through sale closing based on latest cash balance through August 16, 2024.                        |
| 8/23/2024                                       | R. Cohen       | 0.8   | Reviewed variance report for the week ended 8/16.                                                                                       |

| Date                                            | Professional   | Hours | Description                                                                                                     |
|-------------------------------------------------|----------------|-------|-----------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------|
| <b>19. Cash Flow/Cash Management/ Liquidity</b> |                |       |                                                                                                                 |
| 8/25/2024                                       | R. Zaidman     | 1.3   | Reviewed materials provided by AlixPartners (J. Amico) re: extended liquidity forecast through 10/18.           |
| 8/25/2024                                       | R. Cohen       | 0.8   | Reviewed extended cash flow forecast (through 10/18) provided by the Debtors.                                   |
| 8/25/2024                                       | R. Zaidman     | 0.3   | Corresponded with AlixPartners (J. Amico) re: diligence requests for liquidity forecast.                        |
| 8/26/2024                                       | R. Cohen       | 2.9   | Analyzed the Debtors' wind down budget.                                                                         |
| 8/26/2024                                       | A. Kashanirokh | 2.9   | Prepared cash flow schedule related to wind down budget analysis.                                               |
| 8/26/2024                                       | A. Kashanirokh | 2.8   | Edited 8/28 cash report to reflect the Debtors' wind down budget based on comments from BRG team.               |
| 8/26/2024                                       | R. Cohen       | 2.7   | Prepared commentary for 8/28 DIP and liquidity report for the UCC related to the Debtors' wind down budget.     |
| 8/26/2024                                       | R. Cohen       | 2.5   | Reviewed analysis prepared by junior staff related to interest and fees accrued on unfunded DIP amount.         |
| 8/26/2024                                       | R. Zaidman     | 1.2   | Analyzed liquidity materials received from AlixPartners (J. Amico) through sales closing.                       |
| 8/26/2024                                       | A. Kashanirokh | 1.0   | Prepared debt payment schedule related to wind down budget analysis.                                            |
| 8/26/2024                                       | R. Zaidman     | 0.8   | Analyzed liquidity materials received from Kirkland (C. Ceresa) re: post sale closing holdbacks.                |
| 8/26/2024                                       | R. Cohen       | 0.7   | Continued to analyze the Debtors' wind down budget.                                                             |
| 8/26/2024                                       | D. Galfus      | 0.7   | Participated in a call with AlixPartners (J. Zermeno; M. Del Priore) re: the cash forecast.                     |
| 8/26/2024                                       | R. Cohen       | 0.7   | Participated in a call with AlixPartners (M. DelPiore, J. Zermeno) re: variance report for the week ended 8/16. |
| 8/26/2024                                       | R. Zaidman     | 0.7   | Participated in call with AlixPartners (J. Zermeno; M. Del Priore) re: cash results through August 16, 2024.    |
| 8/26/2024                                       | R. Zaidman     | 0.5   | Analyzed BRG draft analysis on costs incurred on DIP financing.                                                 |
| 8/26/2024                                       | R. Zaidman     | 0.4   | Corresponded with MWE (K. Going, M. Kandestin) re: go forward liquidity forecast through sales closing.         |
| 8/26/2024                                       | R. Zaidman     | 0.3   | Participated in call with AlixPartners (J. Amico) re: go forward liquidity forecast.                            |

| Date                                            | Professional   | Hours | Description                                                                                                                        |
|-------------------------------------------------|----------------|-------|------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------|
| <b>19. Cash Flow/Cash Management/ Liquidity</b> |                |       |                                                                                                                                    |
| 8/27/2024                                       | R. Cohen       | 2.9   | Edited 8/28 DIP and liquidity report for the UCC based on comments from BRG.                                                       |
| 8/27/2024                                       | R. Cohen       | 1.7   | Continued to edit 8/28 DIP and liquidity report for the UCC based on comments from BRG.                                            |
| 8/27/2024                                       | R. Cohen       | 1.5   | Analyzed the Debtors' extended cash flow forecast (through 10/18).                                                                 |
| 8/27/2024                                       | D. Galfus      | 1.4   | Revised BRG's weekly presentation for the Committee and Counsel re: liquidity matters.                                             |
| 8/27/2024                                       | R. Zaidman     | 1.2   | Reviewed draft section of BRG reporting on forecast through assumed sale closings.                                                 |
| 8/27/2024                                       | R. Cohen       | 1.2   | Reviewed revised draft of 8/28 DIP and liquidity report for the UCC prepared by junior staff.                                      |
| 8/27/2024                                       | R. Zaidman     | 1.1   | Reviewed draft section BRG reporting on liquidity through August 16, 2024.                                                         |
| 8/27/2024                                       | R. Zaidman     | 0.8   | Reviewed draft section of BRG reporting on forecast on liquidity holdbacks.                                                        |
| 8/27/2024                                       | R. Zaidman     | 0.8   | Reviewed latest update of BRG liquidity reporting to the Committee.                                                                |
| 8/27/2024                                       | R. Zaidman     | 0.7   | Analyzed latest draft wind down reserve forecast from AlixPartners (J. Zermeno).                                                   |
| 8/27/2024                                       | R. Zaidman     | 0.6   | Provided comments to the BRG team re: report on liquidity, latest forecast through sale closings and holdbacks.                    |
| 8/28/2024                                       | A. Kashanirokh | 2.7   | Drafted variance report based on projected 10/18 wind down budget from Debtors.                                                    |
| 8/28/2024                                       | A. Kashanirokh | 2.6   | Prepared variance report based on projected 10/18 wind down budget from Debtors.                                                   |
| 8/28/2024                                       | R. Cohen       | 2.2   | Updated analysis related to interest and fees related to DIP commitments based on comments from BRG team.                          |
| 8/28/2024                                       | R. Cohen       | 1.7   | Reviewed analysis prepared by junior staff related to actual results versus forecasted performance in extended cash flow forecast. |
| 8/28/2024                                       | R. Cohen       | 1.5   | Edited analysis related to interest and fees accrued on unfunded DIP amount based on comments from BRG team.                       |
| 8/28/2024                                       | R. Cohen       | 0.8   | Participated in a call with MWE (M. Kandestin and K. Going) re: agenda for Committee call.                                         |
| 8/28/2024                                       | R. Cohen       | 0.7   | Reviewed schedule prepared by junior staff related to DIP funding.                                                                 |

| Date                                            | Professional   | Hours        | Description                                                                                                        |
|-------------------------------------------------|----------------|--------------|--------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------|
| <b>19. Cash Flow/Cash Management/ Liquidity</b> |                |              |                                                                                                                    |
| 8/28/2024                                       | R. Zaidman     | 0.3          | Reviewed BRG analysis of certain costs incurred on DIP facility.                                                   |
| 8/29/2024                                       | A. Kashanirokh | 1.7          | Prepared unused portion of DIP schedule using supporting documents related to Debtors' wind down budget.           |
| 8/30/2024                                       | A. Kashanirokh | 2.2          | Prepared weekly cash and liquidity report for presentation related to weekly UCC meeting.                          |
| 8/30/2024                                       | R. Cohen       | 2.1          | Analyzed the Debtors' payables assumption in its go forward budget as compared to actual results to date.          |
| 8/30/2024                                       | J. Rogala      | 1.8          | Reviewed liquidity data package with week ended 8/23 data from Debtors' advisors.                                  |
| 8/30/2024                                       | D. Galfus      | 1.2          | Reviewed revised cash forecast prepared by the Debtors                                                             |
| 8/30/2024                                       | R. Zaidman     | 0.9          | Reviewed Debtors' weekly DIP reporting package through August 23, 2024.                                            |
| 8/30/2024                                       | R. Cohen       | 0.7          | Reviewed DIP and liquidity report prepared by junior staff related to the variance report for the week ended 2/23. |
| <b>Task Code Total Hours</b>                    |                | <b>116.5</b> |                                                                                                                    |
| <b>25. Litigation</b>                           |                |              |                                                                                                                    |
| 8/1/2024                                        | D. Galfus      | 1.2          | Reviewed Debtors' investigation report                                                                             |
| 8/2/2024                                        | D. Galfus      | 0.6          | Reviewed Debtors' investigation report.                                                                            |
| 8/5/2024                                        | R. Zaidman     | 0.7          | Reviewed certain request for production files as sent by MWE (R. Trickey).                                         |
| 8/5/2024                                        | D. Galfus      | 0.4          | Reviewed investigation report prepared by the Debtors.                                                             |
| 8/7/2024                                        | R. Zaidman     | 1.6          | Reviewed discovery related files received to date from MWE (M. Kandestin).                                         |
| 8/8/2024                                        | A. Kashanirokh | 2.9          | Analyzed the Debtors' historical financials re: investigation workstream                                           |
| 8/8/2024                                        | A. Kashanirokh | 2.6          | Continued to analyze the Debtors' historical financials re: investigation workstream                               |
| 8/8/2024                                        | A. Kashanirokh | 2.4          | Continued to analyze the Debtors' historical financials re: investigation workstream                               |
| 8/8/2024                                        | R. Zaidman     | 1.2          | Reviewed SEC filings as it relates to the investigation                                                            |
| 8/8/2024                                        | K. McColgan    | 0.9          | Reviewed internal investigation summary presentation by Debtors' Counsel.                                          |

| Date                  | Professional    | Hours | Description                                                                                    |
|-----------------------|-----------------|-------|------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------|
| <b>25. Litigation</b> |                 |       |                                                                                                |
| 8/8/2024              | K. McColgan     | 0.9   | Reviewed quarterly financial statements for 2022-2023 re: investigation workstream.            |
| 8/9/2024              | A. Kashanirokh  | 2.6   | Analyzed key documents related to investigation analysis.                                      |
| 8/9/2024              | R. Zaidman      | 1.8   | Reviewed investigation related documents re: document production files received from MWE.      |
| 8/9/2024              | A. Kashanirokh  | 1.6   | Continued to analyze key documents related to investigation analysis.                          |
| 8/9/2024              | K. McColgan     | 0.9   | Reviewed analysis of non Debtor entities financial overview re: investigation workstream.      |
| 8/9/2024              | K. McColgan     | 0.4   | Reviewed 2015.3 filing.                                                                        |
| 8/9/2024              | K. McColgan     | 0.4   | Reviewed first day declaration of J. Bibb.                                                     |
| 8/9/2024              | K. McColgan     | 0.4   | Reviewed summary of SOFAs and SOALs as it relates to the investigation workstream.             |
| 8/11/2024             | K. McColgan     | 0.4   | Reviewed document production as it relates to investigation workstream.                        |
| 8/12/2024             | K. McColgan     | 0.9   | Reviewed business plan files produced by Debtors in response to document request.              |
| 8/12/2024             | R. Zaidman      | 0.8   | Analyzed certain discovery production files re: investigation.                                 |
| 8/12/2024             | K. McColgan     | 0.6   | Reviewed annual financial statements for 2021-2023 re: investigation workstream.               |
| 8/12/2024             | K. McColgan     | 0.3   | Reviewed formal document request list and tracker from Counsel related to the investigation.   |
| 8/13/2024             | J. Rogala       | 2.6   | Reviewed special Committee report on potential causes of action.                               |
| 8/13/2024             | R. Muruganandam | 1.0   | Reviewed support file related to rule 2015.3 filing for accuracy.                              |
| 8/13/2024             | D. Galfus       | 0.6   | Evaluated the status of the litigation work streams.                                           |
| 8/13/2024             | R. Zaidman      | 0.6   | Reviewed draft reporting from MWE (M. Gibson) re: investigation status.                        |
| 8/13/2024             | K. McColgan     | 0.4   | Reviewed draft presentation to UCC on discovery materials received from Counsel.               |
| 8/13/2024             | K. McColgan     | 0.2   | Corresponded with MWE (M. Kandestin, K. Schwam, R. Tickey) re: access to document productions. |

| Date                  | Professional   | Hours | Description                                                                                          |
|-----------------------|----------------|-------|------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------|
| <b>25. Litigation</b> |                |       |                                                                                                      |
| 8/14/2024             | J. Rogala      | 2.9   | Indexed documents in discovery request data room.                                                    |
| 8/14/2024             | K. McColgan    | 1.1   | Reviewed documents in database from MWE re: investigation.                                           |
| 8/14/2024             | K. McColgan    | 0.4   | Reviewed database index prepared by BRG staff (J. Rogala).                                           |
| 8/15/2024             | K. McColgan    | 0.6   | Reviewed investigation information.                                                                  |
| 8/16/2024             | K. McColgan    | 0.9   | Reviewed database provided by Counsel for documents relative to investigation matters.               |
| 8/16/2024             | K. McColgan    | 0.2   | Developed work plan for new staff to work through next week regarding document review.               |
| 8/19/2024             | K. McColgan    | 1.1   | Reviewed document index in data room for potentially relevant files.                                 |
| 8/20/2024             | A. Kashanirokh | 1.4   | Retrieved key historical documents in database related to investigations work stream.                |
| 8/20/2024             | K. McColgan    | 1.4   | Reviewed certain documents related to the Debtors' sale of a certain asset.                          |
| 8/21/2024             | A. Kashanirokh | 2.5   | Retrieved key historical documents in database related to investigations work stream.                |
| 8/21/2024             | A. Kashanirokh | 1.2   | Continued to retrieve key historical documents in database related to investigations work stream.    |
| 8/21/2024             | K. McColgan    | 0.9   | Reviewed certain documents related to the Debtors' sale of a certain asset.                          |
| 8/21/2024             | R. Zaidman     | 0.7   | Analyzed latest draft reporting from MWE (R. Trickey) re: investigation work stream.                 |
| 8/22/2024             | A. Kashanirokh | 2.8   | Analyzed supporting files provided by the Debtors related to investigations work stream.             |
| 8/22/2024             | A. Kashanirokh | 2.5   | Continued to analyze supporting files provided by the Debtors related to investigations work stream. |
| 8/22/2024             | A. Kashanirokh | 1.6   | Continued to analyze supporting files provided by the Debtors related to investigations work stream. |
| 8/22/2024             | K. McColgan    | 1.1   | Reviewed certain documents related to a certain transaction by the Debtors.                          |
| 8/23/2024             | A. Kashanirokh | 2.2   | Continued to analyze supporting files provided by the Debtors related to investigations work stream. |

| Date                         | Professional   | Hours        | Description                                                                                   |
|------------------------------|----------------|--------------|-----------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------|
| <b>25. Litigation</b>        |                |              |                                                                                               |
| 8/23/2024                    | A. Kashanirokh | 2.0          | Analyzed supporting files provided by the Debtors related to investigations work stream.      |
| 8/23/2024                    | K. McColgan    | 0.9          | Reviewed certain Board minutes as it relates to investigation workstream.                     |
| 8/23/2024                    | D. Galfus      | 0.6          | Evaluated the investigation status.                                                           |
| 8/26/2024                    | A. Kashanirokh | 1.6          | Reviewed presentation materials provided by the Debtor related to investigations work stream. |
| 8/26/2024                    | K. McColgan    | 1.4          | Reviewed witness interview notes produced by the Debtors re: investigation workstream.        |
| 8/27/2024                    | A. Kashanirokh | 1.6          | Reviewed witness interview notes produced by the Debtors re: investigation workstream.        |
| 8/27/2024                    | A. Kashanirokh | 1.5          | Analyzed Debtors' investigation presentation.                                                 |
| 8/27/2024                    | K. McColgan    | 0.9          | Reviewed certain Board minutes as it relates to investigation workstream.                     |
| 8/28/2024                    | A. Kashanirokh | 1.4          | Reviewed certain presentation materials as it relates to the investigation workstream.        |
| 8/28/2024                    | K. McColgan    | 1.1          | Reviewed documents from data room considered relevant to investigation workstream.            |
| <b>Task Code Total Hours</b> |                | <b>70.4</b>  |                                                                                               |
| <b>Total Hours</b>           |                | <b>460.5</b> |                                                                                               |